

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

Clay M. Gatens
Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn & Aylward, P.S.
PO Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688
(509) 662-3685 / (509) 662-2452

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT

EASTERN DISTRICT OF WASHINGTON

LAURA ZAMORA JORDAN, as her
separate estate, and on behalf of others
similarly situated,

Plaintiffs,

vs.

NATIONSTAR MORTGAGE, LLC, a
Delaware Limited liability company,

Defendant,

and

FEDERAL HOUSING FINANCE
AGENCY,

Intervenor-Defendant.

NO. 2:14-cv-00175-TOR

DECLARATION OF CLAY M. GATENS
IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S
MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND
SERVICE AWARDS

CLASS ACTION

CLAY M. GATENS, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, declares:

1. I am a principal and partner at Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn & Aylward, P.S.

CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 (“JDSA”), and an attorney for the Plaintiff in the above matter. I base this declaration upon
2 my own personal knowledge, and I am competent to testify to the matters asserted herein.

3 2. JDSA is lead class counsel in this case: *Laura Zamora Jordan v. Nationstar*
4 *Mortgage, LLC*. I am the lead attorney in the case and successfully argued the case in front
5 of the Washington State Supreme Court, resulting in *Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage, LLC*,
6 185 Wn.2d 876, 374 Wn.2d 976 (2016), the *en banc* opinion holding that property-related
7 activities such as those at issue in this case violate Washington law. I also argued this case
8 in front of the Ninth Circuit in *Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage, LLC*, 781 F.3d 1178 (9th
9 Cir. 2015) relating to removal under the Class Action Fairness Act. JDSA has litigated or
10 is litigating a number of cases involving default borrowers and preforeclosure property
11 preservation activities conducted by lenders, loan servicers, and property services
12 companies. Our experience in these cases allowed me and my team to efficiently
13 investigate the claims of Washington borrowers, analyze the risk of recovering damages
14 and adjudicating liability on a class-wide basis, focus litigation strategy, and take
15 aggressive yet efficient approaches to property preservation litigation.

16 3. As lead counsel in this matter, I have worked cooperatively with my co-
17 counsel to ensure that we divided tasks in a manner that avoided duplication and allowed
18 us to maximize each attorney’s skill and experience, both within and amongst our firms.
19 Through regular telephone conferences and email communication, we limited duplication

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY’S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 of work while obtaining valuable strategic insight from attorneys with a broad range of
2 experience and expertise. For example, my firm took the lead on depositions and discovery
3 matters, Mr. Daudt took the lead on expert witness work, and Ms. Terrell's firm took the
4 lead on most of the briefing submitted to this Court.

5 4. Before removal to this Court, this case was actively prosecuted by my firm in
6 Chelan County Superior Court. The Chelan County Superior Court's docket sheet for this
7 matter reflects more than 120 entries during more than two years of litigation. JDSA's time
8 records also reflect the significant work done on the case in state court.

9 5. Both parties conducted significant discovery before the case was removed,
10 including both written discovery and depositions. In addition, my firm actively investigated
11 the claims of absent members of the proposed class. We filed in support of class
12 certification more than 30 declarations from Washington homeowners describing the
13 damage done by Nationstar's pre-foreclosure lock changes and other property preservation
14 measures.

15 6. The parties litigated and the state court ruled on both discovery motions and
16 class certification prior to removal to this Court.

17 7. JDSA undertook representation of the Plaintiff and the putative class in this
18 case on a contingent basis.

19
20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 3

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 8. While at JDSA, I was also the lead attorney in *Nathan F. Elmore v. Bank of*
2 *America N.A.*, No. 2:14-CV-241-JLQ, E.D. Wash. and *David and Rhonda Huber and D&R*
3 *Capital, LLC v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.*, No. CV-15-00051-TSZ, W.D. Wash. Both of
4 these cases involved similar claims arising from pre-foreclosure lock changes conducted
5 in Washington prior to the Washington Supreme Court’s decision in *Jordan v. Nationstar*
6 *Mortgage, LLC*, 185 Wn.2d 876, 374 Wn.2d 976 (2016). Both of these cases were settled
7 on an individual basis without class certification. Both of these cases settled for
8 significantly less than the economic value of the time that myself and my firm invested into
9 them.

10 9. I acted as a homeowner advocate in front of the Washington State Legislature
11 during the 2017 and 2018 legislative session and the passing of 2018 Wash. Sess. Laws ch.
12 306 §§ 10–13. During the 2017-2018 legislative session, lender, loan servicers, and
13 property preservation companies lobbied to include in proposed HB 2057 a provision that
14 would provide retroactive immunity for lenders, loan servicers, and property preservation
15 companies that conducted pre-foreclosure lock changes prior to the Washington Supreme
16 Court’s decision in *Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage, LLC*, 185 Wn.2d 876, 374 Wn.2d 976
17 (2016). These lenders, loan servicers, property preservation companies, and the lobbyists
18 they employed specifically referred to the legislation they proposed to provide retroactive
19 immunity as the “Jordan fix”. As an advocate for homeowners and consumers, I

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY’S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 4

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 participated in the meetings, Senate Judiciary hearings, and drafting of various revisions to
2 proposed legislation over the course of eight months between November 2016 and July
3 2017. As an advocate for homeowners and consumers I fought to oppose the retroactive
4 immunity sought by lenders, loan servicers, and property preservation companies. Had the
5 lenders, loan servicers, and property preservation companies been successful in passing
6 legislation that contained retroactive immunity for conducting pre-foreclosure lock
7 changes it would eliminated the ability for a homeowner to recover against a lender, loan
8 servicer, or property preservation companies that conducted a pre-foreclosure lock change.

9 10. Attached hereto as Exhibit 2 is a true and correct copy of the Declaration of
10 Lili Sotelo filed in *Rhodes v. Wells Fargo Bank, N.A.*, No. 2:17-CV-0093-SMJ. Ms.
11 Sotelo's declaration further details lobbying by the lender and loan servicing industries
12 related to pre-foreclosure lock changes and property preservation after the Washington
13 Supreme Court issued its decision in this case.

14 **Qualifications of JDSA Attorneys and Staff**

15 11. Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn & Aylward ("JDSA") is a law firm in Wenatchee,
16 Washington that has been in existence since 1946. Its complex civil litigation practice
17 group focuses on complex civil and commercial litigation with an emphasis on consumer
18 protection class actions. JDSA has prosecuted (and is prosecuting) multiple putative and
19 certified consumer class actions, which include enforcement of borrowers' pre-foreclosure

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 5

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 rights. JDSA bases its billable rates on a variety of factors, including experience, ability,
2 skill, education, and reputation.

3 12. I am principal and partner at JDSA and lead attorney from JDSA in this
4 case. I lead the complex civil litigation practice group at JDSA, and I am the lead attorney
5 in the instant matter. I focus on consumer protection, commercial real estate, and wage and
6 hour matters. I have been actively involved in every aspect of every class action prosecuted
7 by my firm since 2010. I have been practicing since 2003, and have been a principal at
8 Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn & Aylward, P.S. since 2013. I am admitted to the Washington
9 State Bar, and have argued in front of a number of courts, including the United States
10 District Courts for the Eastern and Western Districts of Washington, the United States
11 Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit, and the Washington Supreme Court.

12 13. I received a B.A. from the University of Washington in 1998. In 2004, I
13 received my J.D., magna cum laude, from Seattle University School of Law, where I served
14 on the Moot Court Honor Board, Law Review, and as Vice-Chair and member of the
15 Executive Board. In 2004, I also received the University of Washington's Master's
16 Certificate in Commercial Real Estate.

17 14. I served as a Judicial Extern for the Honorable Thomas S. Zilly of the United
18 States District Court for the Western District of Washington in 2002.

19
20 **CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS**

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 15. I was admitted to practice in Washington state in 2003. I am a current Member
2 of the Executive Board for the Washington State Bar Association Real Property, Probate
3 & Trust Section.

4 16. I am a frequent speaker at regional and national Continuing Legal Education
5 (“CLE”) events including the 2016 National Consumer Law Center Annual Conference. I
6 regularly prepare materials and lectures for regional and national CLE programs in the
7 areas of class actions and real estate.

8 17. **H. Lee Lewis** is a principal and partner at JDSA. Lee received a B.A. from
9 Western Washington University in 2010. He received his J.D. From Seattle University
10 School of Law in 2013. During law school, Lee served as an Associate Editor for the Seattle
11 University Law Review. He is admitted to the Washington State Bar, the United States
12 District Courts for the Eastern and Western Districts of Washington, and the Ninth Circuit
13 Court of Appeals. Lee is a member of the United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth
14 Circuit Pro Bono Program, the American Bar Association Council of Appellate Lawyers,
15 and the American Bar Association JD Appellate Judges Conference. Lee is also serving a
16 three-year term as a lawyer representative from the Eastern District of Washington to the
17 Ninth Circuit Judicial Conference. At JDSA, Lee focuses his practice on appellate
18 litigation.

19
20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY’S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 18. **Devon A. Gray** is an associate at JDSA. Devon received a B.A. from Western
2 Washington University in 2012. She received her J.D. from the University of Washington
3 in 2016, graduating first in her class *magna cum laude* and with High Honors. Devon
4 graduated a member of the order of the coif and was the designated Honor Graduate for
5 the University of Washington School of Law 2016 graduating class. During law school,
6 Devon served as Chief Articles Editor for the Washington Law Review and Judicial Extern
7 for the Honorable United States District Court Judge Robert Lasnik. She is admitted to the
8 Washington State Bar Association, the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals, and the United
9 States District Courts for the Eastern and Western Districts of Washington. At JDSA,
10 Devon focuses her practice on federal court consumer protection and wage and hour class
11 actions along with complex commercial litigation in federal court. She a member of the
12 complex civil litigation practice group at JDSA.

13 19. **Michelle A. Green** is a principal and partner at JDSA. She received a B.A.
14 from the University of Washington in 2003. She received her J.D. from Seattle University
15 in 2007. Michelle joined JDSA in 2007 and is admitted to the Washington State Bar
16 Association and the United States District Court for the Eastern District of Washington.
17 She concentrates her practice in real estate and business law and civil litigation and she is
18 a member of the complex civil litigation practice group at JDSA.

19
20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 20. **Robert R. Siderius** is a principal and partner at JDSA. He received a B.A.
2 from the University of Washington in 1992. He received his J.D. from Seattle University
3 in 1982. He joined JDSA in 1985. Bob is admitted to the Washington State Bar
4 Association, the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals, the United States District Courts for
5 Eastern and Western Districts of Washington, and the U.S. Court of Federal Claims. He
6 served as the Chelan-Douglas Bar Association President from 1999–2000. Bob
7 concentrates his practice in civil and commercial litigation and real estate law. He is a
8 member of the complex civil litigation practice group at JDSA.

9 21. **Jacob H. Operalski** was a summer associate at JDSA in 2014. He received
10 his B.A. from Stanford University in 2011 and his M.A. from Stanford University in 2012.
11 He received his J.D. from University of Washington School of Law in 2015. Jacob served
12 as a judicial law clerk for the U.S. District Court in the Western District of Washington
13 from 2015–2017, and for the Nevada State Supreme Court from 2017–2018. He currently
14 serves as an Assistant United States Attorney at the U.S. Department of Justice in Tucson,
15 Arizona.

16 22. **Sally F. White** is a principal and partner at JDSA. She received a B.A. from
17 Gonzaga University in 2005. She received her J.D. from the University of San Francisco,
18 School of Law in 2010, graduating *magna cum laude*. Before joining JDSA, Sally practiced
19 complex commercial litigation at Drinker Biddle and Reath LLP in San Francisco,

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY’S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

1 California. She is admitted to the Washington State Bar Association; California State Bar;
2 United States Court of Appeals for the Ninth Circuit; and the United States District Courts
3 for the Eastern and Western Districts of Washington and the Northern, Eastern, Central,
4 and Southern Districts of California. At JDSA, she is a member of the complex civil
5 litigation practice group and focuses on Intellectual Property Law and complex commercial
6 litigation.

7 23. **Lindsey J. Weidenbach** is a principal and partner at JDSA. She received a
8 B.S. from Gonzaga University in 2007. She received her J.D. from Gonzaga School of Law
9 in 2010, and her L.L.M. in taxation from the University of Washington School of Law in
10 2011. Lindsey is a member of the Washington and Oregon State Bar Associations. At
11 JDSA, Lindsey focuses her practice on agricultural and business law, with specific
12 expertise in highly regulated industries.

13 24. **Eric W. Stokes** is an associate at JDSA. Eric received two B.A. degrees from
14 the University of Montana in 2011. He received his J.D. from Seattle University in 2017,
15 graduating cum laude. During law school, Eric served as Judicial Extern for the Honorable
16 Washington State Supreme Court Justice Charles W. Johnson. Eric is admitted to the
17 Washington State Bar Association and to the U.S. District Court for the Western District
18 of Washington. At JDSA, Eric focuses his practice on business and commercial litigation
19 and is a member of the complex civil litigation practice group.

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 10

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 25. **Robin W. Hansen** is a former associate at JDSA. Robin W. Hansen was an
2 Associate Attorney at JDSA from September, 2014 through September, 2017. She
3 received a B.A. from the University of Puget Sound in 2009. She received her MBA and
4 J.D. from Willamette University in 2014. Robin is admitted to the Washington State Bar
5 Association and currently serves as in-house counsel for a large agricultural
6 company. While at JDSA she concentrated her practice in corporate and business, real
7 estate, and estate planning.

8 26. **Brian C. Huber** is a principal and the managing partner at JDSA. Brian
9 received his B.A. from the university of Washington in 1990. He received his J.D. From
10 the University of Washington School of Law in 1994. Brian is a member of the Washington
11 State Bar Association and is admitted to practice in the United States District Courts for
12 the Eastern and Western Districts of Washington, the United States Bankruptcy Courts of
13 the Eastern and Western Districts of Washington, and the Colville Tribal Court. He served
14 as President of the Chelan-Douglas Counties Bar Association from 2009–2010. Brian
15 concentrates his practice in business, real estate, and complex litigation and is a member
16 of JDSA’s complex civil litigation practice group.

17 27. **J. Patrick Aylward** is of counsel and a founding partner at JDSA. Pat
18 received his B.A. from Stanford University in 1973. He received his J.D. from the
19 University of Washington School of Law in 1976. Pat is a member of the Washington Bar

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY’S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 11

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 Association, the Washington Bar Association Land Use and Environmental Section, the
2 American Bar Association, the Pacific Real Estate Institute, and a fellow of the American
3 College of Real Estate Lawyers. Pat served as the president of the Chelan-Douglas County
4 Bar Association in 1990 and 1991. He was the WSBA Legislative Committee chairman
5 from 1994-1995. He was a member of the Executive Council of the Washington State Bar
6 Association Real Property, Probate, and Trust Law Section from 1991-1993. Pat is
7 admitted to the United States District Courts of Eastern and Western Washington, as well
8 as the Ninth Circuit Court of Appeals. Pat concentrates his practice on business and real
9 estate law and litigation, as well as alternative dispute resolution.

10 28. **Michaela C. Reeder** is a paralegal at JDSA. Michaela received her B.A. from
11 Washington State University and her A.A.S. in Paralegal Studies from Highline
12 Community College. She has more than 20 years of experience and, before joining JDSA
13 she served as a Certified Public Records Officer and a paralegal for U.S. Army JAG Corps.
14 At JDSA, Michaela concentrates her practice on civil and complex litigation. She serves
15 as the lead paralegal for JDSA's complex civil litigation practice group.

16 29. **Heidi M. Holland** is a real estate paralegal at JDSA. Heidi specializes in real
17 estate research and document drafting. She has served in the real estate field, including as
18 a title officer, since 2002 and has been a real estate paralegal with JDSA since 2008. Heidi
19 is a member of the National Association of Professional Mortgage Women and served as

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 12

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 Director of the organization for five years. Heidi is a member of the JDSA real estate
2 paralegal practice group.

3 Attorneys' Fees

4 30. Class Counsel have received no payment for their fees and costs. The
5 following table identifies the attorneys and paralegals from JDSA who worked on this case
6 for more than 10 hours and for whom the recovery of fees is sought. For each of the
7 timekeepers below, I have stated the current hourly rate, the number of hours billed after
8 reductions in time billed for duplicative or excessive work, and the total amount of fees.

	Rate	Hours	Total
9 Clay M. Gatens 10 J.D. from Seattle University School of Law, 2004	\$350	2608.75	\$912,064.50
11 H. Lee Lewis 12 J.D. from Seattle University School of Law, 2013	\$285	239.80	\$64,866.00
13 Devon A. Gray 14 J.D. from University of Washington School of Law, 2012	\$230	271.72	\$57,090.60
15 Michelle A. Green 16 J.D. from Seattle University School of Law, 2007	\$285	165.05	\$47,039.25
17 Robert R. Siderius 18 J.D. from Seattle University School of Law, 1985	\$390	53.10	\$64,866.00
19 Jacob H. Operskalski 20 J.D. from University of Washington School of Law, 2015	\$100	39.82	\$3,982.00
Sally F. White J.D. from University of San Francisco, School of Law, 2010	\$285	33.10	\$6,441.00

CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 13

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

	Rate	Hours	Total
Lindsey J. Weidenbach J.D. from Gonzaga School of Law, 2010, LLM from Gonzaga School of Law, 2011	\$285	21.00	\$5,985.00
Eric W. Stokes J.D. from Seattle University School of Law, 2017	\$230	19.80	\$3,519.00
Robin W. Hansen J.D. from Willamette University School of Law, 2014	\$230	17.80	\$4,094.00
Brian C. Huber J.D. from University of Washington School of Law, 1994	\$390	12.45	\$4,855.50
J. Patrick Aylward J.D. from University of Washington School of Law, 1976	\$390	11.30	\$4,570.50
Michaela C. Reeder Paralegal	\$100	95.00	\$9,490.00
Heidi M. Holland Paralegal	\$100	10.84	\$1,084.00
TOTAL		3,599.53	\$1,145,790.35

31. Since beginning work on this case in 2011, JDSA worked with no guarantee of being compensated for its time and efforts. Payment of JDSA's fees has always been contingent on successfully obtaining relief for the Plaintiff and class members. As a result, there was a substantial risk of non-payment, particularly in light of the legal challenges involved in litigating this case. Work on this case has necessarily been to the exclusion of work on other matters that likely would have generated fees. JDSA has also been denied use of the fees it earned over the course of the case.

CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 14

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 32. We have reviewed JDSA's billing records and reduced and eliminated time
2 where appropriate. We eliminated time that was administrative in nature, and made
3 reductions where time arguably could have been more efficiently spent.

4 33. The lodestar does not include the work we will do after completion of this
5 motion, which will include working with the settlement administrator, preparing the motion
6 for final approval and attending the hearing, and communicating with class members.

7 34. Attached as Exhibit 1 is a spreadsheet that provides JDSA's detailed time
8 records in chronological order by timekeeper. The spreadsheet is a compilation of the
9 contemporaneous, daily time reports prepared and maintained by JDSA timekeepers in the
10 regular course of business. We have redacted information from the time reports that would
11 reveal work product, which are otherwise provided in full.

12 JDSA'S Rates

13 35. JDSA sets its rates for attorney and staff members based on a variety of
14 factors, including among others: the experience, skill and sophistication required for the
15 types of legal services typically performed; the rates customarily charged in similar
16 matters; the rates customarily charged by other lawyers of similar skill and experienced;
17 and the experience, reputation, and ability of the attorneys and staff members. We set our
18 rates to be consistent with the prevailing market rate in the private sector for attorneys and
19

20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 15

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 staff of comparable skill, qualifications and experience who litigate class actions and
2 complex litigation.

3 JDSA's Litigation Costs

4 36. Through the date of this submission, JDSA has incurred \$111,587.07 in
5 unreimbursed litigation costs in prosecuting this case. These costs are customarily charged
6 to and paid by hourly clients. The following chart summarizes JDSA's litigation costs.

7 Type of Cost	Amount
Air fare	\$1,407.57
8 Appellate Court Printing	\$62.37
Computer Research	\$1,159.45
9 Copies	\$292.00
Courier and Postage	\$358.63
10 Court Filing Fee	\$230.00
Court Transcripts	\$81.00
11 Deposition Transcripts	\$11,137.90
Expert Fees	\$79,717.72
12 Hotel	\$9,069.27
Meals	\$839.34
Mediation Fees	\$1,267.50
14 Mileage	\$2,748.42
Public Records Request	\$4.70
15 Record Retrieval Service	\$218.12
Service of Process	\$678.50
16 Supplies for Trial	\$401.05
Taxis and Parking	\$1,019.53
17 Third party deed of trust review/cataloguing	\$894.00
18 TOTAL	\$111,587.07

19
20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 16

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of Washington that the
2 foregoing is true and correct.

3 DATED the 25th day of January, 2019.

4
5 s/CLAY M. GATENS

6 Clay M. Gatens, WSBA No. 34102

7 JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.

8 2600 Chester Kimm Road

9 P.O. Box 1688

10 Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

11 Telephone: 509-662-3685

12 Fax: 509-662-2452

13 Email: ClayG@jdsalaw.com

14
15 Attorneys for Plaintiff
16
17
18
19
20

CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 17

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.

Attorneys at Law

(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452

2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688

Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Beth E. Terrell, hereby certify that on January 25, 2019, I electronically filed the foregoing with the Clerk of the Court using the CM/ECF system which will send notification of such filing to the following:

John A. Knox, WSBA #12707
Attorneys for Defendant
WILLIAMS, KASTNER & GIBBS PLLC
601 Union Street, Suite 4100
Seattle, Washington 98101-2380
Telephone:(206) 628-6600
Facsimile: (206) 628-6611
Email: jknox@williamskastner.com

Andrew W. Noble, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
Jan T. Chilton, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
Mary Kate Sullivan, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
Mark D. Lonergan, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
Attorneys for Defendant
SEVERSON & WERSON, P.C.
One Embarcadero Center, 26th Floor
San Francisco, California 94111
Telephone: (415) 677-3344
Facsimile: (415) 956-0439
Email: awn@severson.com
Email: jtc@severson.com
Email: mks@severson.com
Email: mdl@severson.com

CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 18

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 Daniel J. Gibbons, WSBA #33036
Attorneys for Intervenor Federal Housing Finance Agency
2 WITHERSPOON KELLEY
422 West Riverside Avenue, Suite 1100
3 Spokane, Washington 99201
Telephone: (509) 624-5265
4 Facsimile: (509) 458-2728
Email: djg@witherspoonkelley.com

5
6 Howard N. Cayne, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
David B. Bergman, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
Asim Varma, *Admitted Pro Hac Vice*
Attorneys for Intervenor Federal Housing Finance Agency
7 ARNOLD & PORTER LLP
8 601 Massachusetts Avenue, N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20001
9 Telephone: (202) 942-5656
Facsimile: (202) 942-5999
10 Email: howard.cayne@aporter.com
Email: david.bergman@aporter.com
11 Email: asim.varma@aporter.com

12 Bruce P. Kriegman
Special Master
13 KRIEGMAN LAW OFFICE, PLLC
600 University Street, Suite 2100
14 Seattle, Washington 98101
bkriegman@kriegmanlaw.com
15 sblan@kriegmanlaw.com

16 I further certify that I caused true and correct copies of the foregoing to be
17 served via U.S. First Class Mail, postage prepaid upon the following:

18
19
20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 19

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 Michael P. Klein, WSBA #18079
2 Chapter 7 Trustee In re Angela M. Couch (aka Angela Marguarite
3 Caspers) and Wesley Gordon Caspers
4 330 Madison Avenue South, Suite 110
5 Bainbridge Island, Washington 98110
6 Telephone: (206) 842-3638
7 Facsimile: (206) 842-1541
8 Email: attorneyklein@hotmail.com

9 DATED this 25th day of January, 2019.

10 TERRELL MARSHALL LAW GROUP PLLC

11 By: /s/ Beth E. Terrell, WSBA #26759

12 Beth E. Terrell, WSBA #26759
13 Attorneys for Plaintiff and the Class
14 936 North 34th Street, Suite 300
15 Seattle, Washington 98103
16 Telephone: (206) 816-6603
17 Facsimile: (206) 319-5450
18 Email: bterrell@terrellmarshall.com

19
20 CLAY M. GATENS IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR AN AWARD OF
ATTORNEY'S FEES, COSTS AND SERVICE
AWARDS

Page 20

590246

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

— EXHIBIT 1 —

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	02/16/2012	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	Research re: causes of action and discovery re class and conduct office conference with C. Gatens re same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	11/06/2012	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Consult w C. Gatens re: discovery and class action issues
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	11/07/2012	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	Revise amendment, additional discovery, motion to compel (.4); conf with C. Gatens and M. Green re same (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	11/14/2012	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference w/M. Green re amended complaint and review same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	12/13/2012	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Revise motion to amend, motion to compel, court hearing re amendment etc. and conduct office conference with C. Gatens re same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	12/28/2012	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Review and consult re: motion to amend, hearing, potential stip order, issue regarding judge/potential conflict
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	12/31/2012	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	Prepare for and handle court hearing re motion to amend
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	01/02/2013	111C		0.25	97.50	Y	Review order granting leave to amend, clerk's minutes etc.
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	01/03/2013	111C		0.25	97.50	Y	Review amended complaint, order re amendment, emails with counsel
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	02/11/2013	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office confernces w/C. Gatens re: deposition outcome, motion strategy going forward
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	03/07/2013	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Review discovery, class cert issues and office conference with C. Gatens re same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	02/24/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Research re class certification and statutes re right to possession
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	04/08/2014	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	Work re litigation strategy, conf with C. Gatens re same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	04/14/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Telecon and emails with potential class co-counsel re meeting, case status

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	01/16/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Work re issue re dot's with other entry language, [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	01/21/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Review suppl. discovery requests, 30(b)(6), certification
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	02/03/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Work re appellate briefing from defendant and path forward; conf with L. Lewis re same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	03/02/2015	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Assist C. Gatens on oral argument prep, conf with C. Gatens re same
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	04/02/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Work re 9th circuit decision and moving forward
2011.0386	0001C	BCH	09/14/2015	111C		1.75	682.50	Y	Review brief and proposed edits (1); mtg with team re briefing and arguments (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/11/2011	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Begin legal research re: causes of action for trespass and CPA
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/11/2011	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Meet with client regarding foreclosure issues (.9); research draft memorandum re: same (1.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/14/2011	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue legal research re: causes of action for statutory trespass and CPA claims and damages
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/14/2011	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	Teleconference with client
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/15/2011	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Review client loan documents (2.3); review correspondences from lender (.5); continue to research potential claims (2.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/15/2011	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Review all loan docs (1.2); research [REDACTED] (.5); office conferences with J. Danielson and M. Green
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/16/2011	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Site visit (1.2); teleconference with client re: claims, suite (.3); research re tort of outrage (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/21/2011	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Legal research re liability theories and available damages (1.3); teleconference with client re same (.2)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/22/2011	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Continue legal research re liability theories and outrage (.6); teleconference with client re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/23/2011	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Return to site to photograph and document lock change and notices (2.0); travel to PUD and obtain copies of utility payments and billing histories and review same (2.8).
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/28/2011	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	Continue legal research on claims, including statutory trespass (2.7); legal research on potential class action allegations (2.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/28/2011	111C		4.70	1,645.00	Y	Continue legal research on claims (1.6); legal research on state class action requirements (3.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2011	111C		5.80	2,030.00	Y	Continue legal research re: claims
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/06/2011	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue legal research re: claims
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/13/2011	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Research class rep duties and obligations and qualifications
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/16/2011	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Prepare for and attend client meeting re: potential action, potential class
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/19/2011	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	Research registered agent info for potential defendants (.25); collect damage information from client (.3); draft contingency fee agreement (.7):
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/20/2011	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Finalize contingency fee agreement (.2); continue legal research re potential causes of action and pleading same (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/27/2011	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Draft notice and demand letter
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/17/2012	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Review claim response from Field Asset Services (.2); office conference with J. Danielson re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/03/2012	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Draft update letter to client
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/04/2012	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	Start draft of complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/06/2012	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/07/2012	111C		4.30	1,505.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/08/2012	111C		4.70	1,645.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/09/2012	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/17/2012	111C		1.40	490.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/21/2012	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Legal research re class action elements
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/22/2012	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/23/2012	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/23/2012	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/24/2012	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Continue drafting complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/29/2012	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Revise complaint and begin drafting discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/01/2012	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Revise complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/02/2012	111C		4.10	1,435.00	Y	Revise of Plaintiff's first discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/05/2012	111C		5.90	2,065.00	Y	Draft and revise Plaintiff's first discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/07/2012	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	Draft and revise Plaintiff's first discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/09/2012	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Draft and revise Plaintiff's first discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/12/2012	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	Finalize first set of discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/16/2012	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Draft and revise letter to client regarding draft complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/20/2012	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Revise complaint per comments from client
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/22/2012	111C		4.90	1,715.00	Y	Finalize and prepare for service and filing summons and complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/17/2012	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	Teleconference with opposing counsel re: action, answer
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/17/2012	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	Draft memo re conversation with OC and conduct research re: request for additional time to answer
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/09/2012	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review answer (.2); office conference with M. Green re same and discovery requests (.3)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/09/2012	111C		3.40	1,190.00	Y	Continue review of answer and affirmative defenses (1.1); draft further discovery requests (2.8); review and revise letter to Laura (.5);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/10/2012	111C		6.60	2,310.00	Y	Draft subpoenas and notice of same (2.5); draft RFAs (4.1);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/16/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Begin drafting discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/18/2012	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Calculate settlement figures and options (.75); continue discovery requests drafts (2.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/23/2012	111C		3.10	1,085.00	Y	Revise Rogs and RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/31/2012	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Teleconference with opp counsel re outstanding discovery and revise discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/10/2012	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Continue revising discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/22/2012	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	Office conference with M. Green re subpoena issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/03/2012	111C		1.30	455.00	Y	Review records custodian responses (.3) office conference and give instructions on status of FAS responses to SDT (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/17/2012	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Draft discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/17/2012	111C		4.10	1,435.00	Y	Gather information and organize documents for responses to Defendant's 1st RFPs to Plaintiff
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/18/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Prepare for and attend office conference w/ J. Danielson re case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/19/2012	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Review documents for responses to Defendant's 1st RFPs to Plaintiff
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/20/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Continue to review documents for responses to Defendant's 1st RFPs to Plaintiff
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/23/2012	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	Continue to review documents for responses to Defendant's 1st RFPs to Plaintiff

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/23/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Continue to review documents for responses to Defendant's 1st RFPs to Plaintiff
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/24/2012	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Review documents produced
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/25/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Draft discovery responses and review documents
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/26/2012	111C		5.60	1,960.00	Y	Review Defendant's discovery responses (2.5); start draft of outline and re same (3.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/27/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Continue revising discovery responses (.4); coordinate with PUD re billing history (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/30/2012	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Continue reviewing discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/31/2012	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Continue reviewing discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/01/2012	111C		0.80	280.00	Y	Revise discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/01/2012	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Legal research re claims under RCW 61.24
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/02/2012	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Legal research re claims under RCW 61.24 (4.5); office conference with M. Green re amending complaint re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/05/2012	111C		4.30	1,505.00	Y	Draft responses and objections to Defendant's RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/06/2012	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	Revise discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/07/2012	111C		2.40	840.00	Y	Revise discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/08/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Draft responses and objections to Defendant's RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/13/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Revise discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/14/2012	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Continue drafting responses and objections to Defendant's RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/15/2012	111C		4.60	1,610.00	Y	Draft responses and objections to Defendant's RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/16/2012	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Office conference with M. Green re revised compliant (.2); e-mail to client re discovery responses (.2); continue revising same (.7)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/16/2012	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	Legal research to support additional claims for amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/17/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Teleconference with client re discovery responses (.6); revise same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/27/2012	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Continue to revise discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/28/2012	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Final review and revisions to RFP objections and responses and organization of all responsive documents
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/29/2012	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Finalize RFP responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/04/2012	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Review documents produced
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/07/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Legal research re procedures for bringing motion for contempt re failure to respond to SDT
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/10/2012	111C		2.10	735.00	Y	Review documents produced by Nationstar
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/12/2012	111C		4.60	1,610.00	Y	Continue reviewing NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/14/2012	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	Continue reviewing NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/19/2012	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	Continue reviewing NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/20/2012	111C		2.10	735.00	Y	Continue reviewing NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/24/2012	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	Office conference with EMC re statutory trespass issues and conduct research same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/25/2012	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Continue reviewing NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/25/2012	111C		5.50	1,925.00	Y	Legal research on statutory trespass issues and damage requirements.
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/26/2012	111C		5.50	1,925.00	Y	Draft summary and outline of NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/27/2012	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Legal research on interplay between CPA claims and statutory trespass

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/28/2012	111C		5.60	1,960.00	Y	Continue legal research on interplay between CPA claims and common law trespass
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/02/2012	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Continue discovery review and create index of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2012	111C		6.30	2,205.00	Y	Continue discovery review and create index of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/04/2012	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Emails with opp counsel re supplemental to discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/04/2012	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Legal research re pleading requirements for 23(b)(2) injunctive relief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/04/2012	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue legal research re pleading requirements for 23(b)(2) injunctive relief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/08/2012	111C		6.30	2,205.00	Y	Continue legal research re pleading requirements for 23(b)(2) injunctive relief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/09/2012	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Continue legal research re pleading requirements for 23(b)(2) injunctive relief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/09/2012	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Legal research on class definitions and subclasses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/10/2012	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Legal research re pleading requirements for 23(b)(2) money damages
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/10/2012	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Continue legal research on class definitions and subclasses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/11/2012	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Legal research on 9th circuit case law for (b)(3) class damages
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/12/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Continue reviewing supplemental discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/16/2012	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Continue reviewing supplemental discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/22/2012	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Continue reviewing supplemental discovery productions

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/23/2012	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	Continue reviewing supplemental discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/31/2012	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Respond to stipulation (.2); prepare for and attend teleconference with opp counsel re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/02/2012	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Draft motion to compel re SDT to MSI
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/03/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Prepare for attend teleconference with opp counsel re employment records (.4); review stipulation re same (.2); draft letter to client re same (.3); review court rules re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/05/2012	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Continue draft motion to compel re SDT to MSI
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/06/2012	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Revise opposition to discovery requests;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/06/2012	111C		5.50	1,925.00	Y	Start draft of second amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/07/2012	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Legal research re: class action requirements
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/08/2012	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Continue research re: class implications
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/08/2012	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Continue research re: class implications
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/09/2012	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Continue research re: class discovery and pleadings
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/12/2012	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Continue drafting second amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/13/2012	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Continue drafting second amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/14/2012	111C		2.10	735.00	Y	Prepare for and attend CR 26i conference (1.9); e-mail to client re affidavit of prejudice (.2);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/15/2012	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Continue drafting second amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/15/2012	111C		5.10	1,785.00	Y	Draft confirming letter re 26i conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/26/2012	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Draft affidavit of prejudice and file same

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/26/2012	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Legal research re NS letter re discovery responses and objections and basis for same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/03/2012	111C		4.90	1,715.00	Y	Draft supplemental discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/03/2012	111C		4.90	1,715.00	Y	Review suppl. discovery requests from NS (1.5); draft supplemental discovery requests to NS (3.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/04/2012	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Review suppl. discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2012	111C		4.10	1,435.00	Y	Legal research re class requirements and implications for discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/07/2012	111C		3.60	1,260.00	Y	Draft calculations of damages for statement of damages
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/10/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Continue drafting statement of damages; review supp discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/11/2012	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue drafting calculations of rental damages for statement of damages
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/12/2012	111C		2.60	910.00	Y	Review MSI discovery (2.2); office conference with M. Green re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/13/2012	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Continue researching class action pleading requirements
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/14/2012	111C		2.10	735.00	Y	Research class action certification requirements and amend to complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/17/2012	111C		1.90	665.00	Y	E-mail to client re motion to amend (.4); revise same (1.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/18/2012	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	Revise motion to amend and amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/19/2012	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Revise motion to amend;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/26/2012	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Research re: certification requirements
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/27/2012	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	Review MSI discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/03/2013	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Coordinate filing of amended complaint (.3); teleconference and e-mail with client re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/03/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue review MSI discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/07/2013	111C		7.80	2,730.00	Y	Review MCS productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/08/2013	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Draft index and outline of MSI discovery productions

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/09/2013	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue drafting index and outline of MCS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/09/2013	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Continue drafting index and outline of all NS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/15/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Index and binder all discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/17/2013	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft status update email and deposition dates to Laura (1.10); multiple emails and scheduling calls with OC re deposition dates (1.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/22/2013	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Review MSI discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/23/2013	111C		2.90	1,015.00	Y	Review MCS discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/28/2013	111C		8.60	3,010.00	Y	Prepare for and draft Rangel deposition outline
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/29/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Organize all relevant discovery for Laura's deposition and draft outline (6.0); meeting with client in advance fo deposition (2.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/30/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	prep for upcoming depositions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/30/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Continue drafting and revising second Rogs re class wide discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/31/2013	111C		8.50	2,975.00	Y	Prepare for and attend deposition of John Rangel in Moses Lake and conduct calls with M. green re: same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/01/2013	111C		10.00	3,500.00	Y	Prepare for, travel to and from and attend and defend deposition of Zamora in Pasco
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/05/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Draft answers to additional discovery (.2); review subpoena of MSI; conduct deposition follow up and draft memorandum re: same (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/05/2013	111C		7.20	2,520.00	Y	Review and organize deposition notes (3.1); draft class wide discovery requests (4.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/11/2013	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Office conference w/ B. Huber re: discovery, related issues

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/13/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Draft responses to suppl. discovery requests from NS
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/14/2013	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Revise class wide discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/19/2013	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Continue draft class wide discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/19/2013	111C		4.40	1,540.00	Y	Continue drafting responses to NS suppl. disco requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/27/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Finalize responses to supplemental discovery for M. Green review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/05/2013	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review objections
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/06/2013	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Research re: propriety of objections
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/07/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Research re: objecitons in preparation of 26i conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/08/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Prepare for and attend CR 26 conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/11/2013	111C		4.40	1,540.00	Y	Office conference with M. Green re case status, additional causes of action and class certification motion, conduct research re: same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/15/2013	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Draft supplemental discovery and RFA's
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/18/2013	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft responses and objections to NS 4th Rogs/RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/18/2013	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Continue drafting responses and objections to NS RFAs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/20/2013	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Continue drafting responses and objections to NS 4th Rogs and RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/21/2013	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue drafting responses and objections to NS RFA's
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/26/2013	111C		5.10	1,785.00	Y	Continue drafting responses and objections to NS RFA's
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/26/2013	111C		5.10	1,785.00	Y	Continue drafting responses and objections to NS RFA's
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/01/2013	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Revise re discovery responses and e-mail to client re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/03/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Revise class discovery requests

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/04/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Communicate with Laura to identify and organize all responsive docs to 4th Rogs/RFPs and coordinatet indexing and bates stamping for production
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/05/2013	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Continue drafting discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/17/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/19/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Review and research discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/22/2013	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Draft response to 4th set of discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/22/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Review MSI productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/24/2013	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Continue reviewing MSI productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/24/2013	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Continue reviewing MSI productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/30/2013	111C		2.25	787.50	Y	Continue reviewing MSI productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/02/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Finish review of MSI discovery (.3); draft letter re same (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/07/2013	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Teleconference with opp counsel re deficiencies
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/13/2013	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Reivew and research discovery deficiencies
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/17/2013	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Finalize supp discovery and damages issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/17/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Review research memo re statutory damages (.5); conduct legal research re same (3.0); office conference with RWH re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/20/2013	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Legal research on statutory damages cap under CPA and draft memorandum
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/23/2013	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Legal research re offer of judgment rules and case law in class action
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/29/2013	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Continue research re: offer of judgment
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/29/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Review research memo re statutory damages (.5); conduct legal research re same (3.0); office conference with RWH re same (.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/30/2013	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Continue researching offer of judgment;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/31/2013	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Continue researching offer of judgment (2.1); teleconference with client re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/12/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Draft and research settlement counter offer (.3); teleconference with client re same (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/26/2013	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	Follow up on discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/09/2013	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Review discovery responses (.4); CR 26i email re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/16/2013	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	prepare for and attend CR 26i conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/17/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review notes and draft confirming memorandum
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/18/2013	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Research re case law and basis for NS objections and non-productions for MTC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/22/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue research re case law and basis for NS objections and non-productions for MTC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/24/2013	111C		5.50	1,925.00	Y	Continue research re case law and basis for NS objections and non-productions for MTC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/26/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue research re case law and basis for NS objections and non-productions for MTC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/26/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue research re case law and basis for NS objections and non-productions for MTC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/29/2013	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Prepare for 26(i) conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/30/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Prepare for and conduct 26i with J. Knox and draft memorandum re: same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/05/2013	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Draft Motion to Compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/06/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Continue drafting Motion to Compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/08/2013	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Continue drafting Motion to Compel

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/12/2013	111C		6.80	2,380.00	Y	Continue drafting Motion to Compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/14/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Continue drafting Motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/14/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Revise Motion to Compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/16/2013	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Draft declaration of C. Gatens ISO Motion to Compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/29/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Revise motion to compel on discovery issues (1.2); draft letter to client (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/30/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Draft motion to certify
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/03/2013	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Legal research re class cert case law in prep for class cert motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/04/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Legal research to support class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/05/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Legal research to support class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/09/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Draft class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/10/2013	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Revise class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/11/2013	111C		5.50	1,925.00	Y	Continue drafting class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/12/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Review docs produced to being to identify exhibits for cert motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/12/2013	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Continue drafting class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/13/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Identify outstanding discovery issues and continue reviewing docs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/16/2013	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Draft 26i letter re: discovery issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/16/2013	111C		4.90	1,715.00	Y	Draft class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/17/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Draft and revise class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/18/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Revise letter re discovery issues (.6); review letter from A. Noble re note up (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/18/2013	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Draft class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/19/2013	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	work re discovery issues; work re motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/19/2013	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Continue drafting and revising class certification motion

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/20/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Revise re motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/20/2013	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Revise class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/22/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Continue revising motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/23/2013	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Continue revising motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/24/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/24/2013	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Draft new section of class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/25/2013	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	continue revising motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/25/2013	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Draft declaration of C. Gatens ISO Class certification motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/25/2013	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Draft declaration of C. Gatens ISO class cert
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/26/2013	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/27/2013	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Draft and revise motion to certify
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/30/2013	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/01/2013	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/02/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Research in support of motion to certify
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2013	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Research in support of motion to certify reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/23/2013	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Review and revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/24/2013	111C		1.75	612.50	Y	Revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/24/2013	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Revise re reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/25/2013	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/28/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	draft portion of motion to certify and research in support of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/29/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	revise motion to certify reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/30/2013	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	revise and finalize reply on motion to certify and coordinate filing of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/04/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	prepare for and attend hearing on motion to compel and for certification
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/07/2013	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	review order granting motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/25/2013	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	review hearing transcript re motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/26/2013	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	draft motion for presentment

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/27/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	communications w/counsel and review and revision of discovery order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/03/2013	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	draft discovery order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2013	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	review NS pleading on order to compel (.4); phone call with M. Green re: same (.2); begin drafting reply (3.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/09/2013	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	prepare for hearing on motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/10/2013	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	prepare for and attend presentment hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/11/2013	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	set up and research system to call witnesses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/20/2013	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	review NS productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/26/2013	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	compile and review list of abandoned properties
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/27/2013	111C		2.30	805.00	Y	continue reviewing NS productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/30/2013	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	continue reviewing NS productions and create call list
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/07/2014	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	draft calling plan
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/13/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	draft script and begin making calls
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/14/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue compiling call list
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/15/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	call absent class members
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/16/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	continue to call absent class members
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/17/2014	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	continue to call absent class members
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/20/2014	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Continue to call absent class members
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/22/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	continue to call absent class members and begin to draft declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/24/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/27/2014	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/28/2014	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/30/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/03/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/04/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/06/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/10/2014	111C		1.90	665.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/11/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/12/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/13/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/14/2014	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	continue calling and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/18/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue to call absent class members and draft declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/20/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	continue to call absent class members and draft declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/22/2014	111C		7.20	2,520.00	Y	continue to call absent class members and draft declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/24/2014	111C		2.85	997.50	Y	continue calling absent class members and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/25/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	continue calling absent class members and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/26/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	continue calling absent class members and draft declarations and emails
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/27/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	continue calling absent class members and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/04/2014	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	continue calling absent members and drafting declarations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/05/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	review and revise supplemental motion to certify;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/06/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	finalize renewed motion for class cert
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/07/2014	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	continue calling class members and drafting declarations

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/10/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	prepare for hearing on motion to continue
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/11/2014	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	review moving papers re: motion to certify and instruct H. Lewis re: additional legal research
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/29/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	draft sections of reply in support of motion to certify
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/31/2014	111C		2.30	805.00	Y	revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/01/2014	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/02/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	revise and finalize renewed motion to certify
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/03/2014	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	prepare for and attend hearing on class certification
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/07/2014	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	draft presentment order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/08/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	legal research re: post certification issues and appeal (3.7); office conference w/SAB re: same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/10/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue research re: class certification, appeal
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/15/2014	111C		3.60	1,260.00	Y	Continue research in preparation for post certification issues (1.9); draft supplemental discovery (2.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/16/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	revise proposed certification order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/17/2014	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	prepare for continued hearing on presentment
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/18/2014	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	travel to and from Seattle and consult with outside counsel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/22/2014	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	revise proposed order and supporting argument (3.9); revise supplemental discovery (1.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/24/2014	111C		0.85	297.50	Y	draft venture agreement
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/30/2014	111C		1.80	630.00	Y	revise supplemental discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/06/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	draft reply re order on class certification
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/07/2014	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	revise reply re: proposed order on class certification (6.2); office conference re: same (.3)

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/08/2014	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	prepare for presentment hearing on order for certification
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/09/2014	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	prepare for and attend hearing on entry of order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/12/2014	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	begin drafting proposed notice to class
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/19/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	research and continue drafting notice of class cert
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/21/2014	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	teleconference with M. Daudt re discovery responses and RFA's (.3); revise same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/26/2014	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	revise proposed notice;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/28/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	review and revise notice of class action (.3); research re appeal issues (2.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/29/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	review and outline responses to RFA's and 5th rog responses;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/30/2014	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	continue outlining and summarizing responses to RFA
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/02/2014	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	follow up w/opposing council re outstanding discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/03/2014	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	review proposed revisions to class notice
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/05/2014	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	prepare for and attend CR 26 i conference with Noble (.8); begin drafting motion to remand (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/09/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	continue drafting motion to remand (.2); telephone conference with cocounsel regarding same (.2); conference with R. Siderius regarding same (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/12/2014	111C		10.50	3,675.00	Y	Travel to Seattle (3); meet with cocounsel, regarding motion to remand and trial plan (7.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/13/2014	111C		10.00	3,500.00	Y	Travel back from Seattle (3.2); meet with cocounsel, regarding motion to remand and trial plan (6.8)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/18/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	research re: remand issues (1.2); review letter from A. Noble re discovery and trial plan and begin drafting response (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/19/2014	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	work re response to A. Noble letter re outstanding discovery (.1); office conference w/RRS re: status (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/20/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	meet with co-counsel re case status and steps moving forward
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/23/2014	111C		4.60	1,610.00	Y	review and draft memo re: outstanding discovery issues (3.5); teleconference with Deanna Jones (1); draft letter and declarations re same (1.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/24/2014	111C		1.90	665.00	Y	research dean jones issue (1.6); review discovery requests; office conference w/M. Green re: pending foreclosure (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/25/2014	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	research re Deanna jones (2.1); research discovery issues (2); prepare and attend conference with Washington state AG and begin coordinating involvement (1.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/26/2014	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	draft memorandum re: outstanding discovery issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/30/2014	111C		1.20	332.00	Y	coordinate with and send pleadings to AG's office for review;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/01/2014	111C		1.20	120.00	Y	legal research re legislative history rcw 61.24
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/03/2014	111C		1.10	600.00	Y	review motion for remand draft (.9); emails with Daudt re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/07/2014	111C		4.00	575.00	Y	draft declaration and revise motion to remand (1.9); draft letter to A. Noble re discovery issues (2.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/09/2014	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Review discovery response letter and prepare to address
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/15/2014	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	review response to motion to remand;

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/16/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	review opposition to motion to remand and begin drafting reply (.2); conference with co counsel re same (.6); legal research re cases cited re same (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/22/2014	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	prepare for and attend meeting with Attorney General
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/22/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	teleconference with co counsel re reply (.6); review same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/08/2014	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	prepare for hearing on motion to remand
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/09/2014	111C		9.80	3,430.00	Y	prepare for and travel to and from Spokane (.8); attend hearing on motion to remand (.8); review order re same (1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/11/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	draft motion to compel and outstanding discovery (.7); draft response motion for discretionary review (1.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/16/2014	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	revise motion to compel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/17/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Revise and draft motion to compel (2); review protective order (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/24/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	finalize motion for fees (2.2); draft response to motion for protective order (.2); conference with co counsel re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2014	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	schedule motion on protective order (.4); research re response to same (2.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/04/2014	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	review and revise response to motion for discretionary review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/06/2014	111C		2.10	735.00	Y	finalize and file response to motion for discretionary review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/08/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	research re: response to atty fee opposition
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/09/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	review response to answer re motion for discretionary review

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/14/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	revise response to motion for protective order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/15/2014	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	revise response to motion for protective order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/16/2014	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	revise response to motion for protective order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/17/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	finalize and file response
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/20/2014	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	prepare for hearing on protective order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/21/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	prepare for and attend hearing on protective order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/23/2014	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	coordinate with Noble re discovery order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/27/2014	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	review proposed order (.2); review class list (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/28/2014	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	communications re: revisions to proposed order; discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/30/2014	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	review Lyons case (.5); review DOT provisions (.4); office conference with L. Lewis re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/04/2014	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	review third Interrogatories (.1); review 30b6 dep notice (.1); final notice to class (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/04/2014	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	revise and review class notice (.3); conf with co counsel re same (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/05/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	teleconference with opposing counsel re 9th circuit appeal (.4); review stipulation and order re bond (.3); research bond requirements (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/06/2014	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	research re rcw 7.6 and receivership claims
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/10/2014	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	review all appeal pleadings and notice (.9); binder and docket same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/12/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	meet with L. Lewis and co-counsel re deadlines for various appeals (.2); conduct research re NS motion to coordinate 9th circuit appeals (1.5); research re: atty fee appeal (.8)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/13/2014	111C		0.80	280.00	Y	teleconference with A. Noble re discovery issues (.2); teleconference w/HLL re: 30(b)(6) notices and other discovery (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/13/2014	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	prepare and conduct teleconference with amber Benson re status of case and resolution of lockout case that they did with other Nationstar borrower and NWJP (.6); prepare for and conduct teleconference with trustee for Deanna Jones re claims (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/14/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	review and revise 30 b 6 notices (.7); teleconference with co-counsel re various appeal issues and timelines (.4); legal research re receivership issues (1.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/18/2014	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	revise 30b6 notice for electronic information
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/18/2014	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Teleconference with opposing counsel re related appeals issues and re motion to expedite appeal re atty fees (.3); review proposed motion re same (.2); provide comment and consent re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/19/2014	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	draft and revise response to 9th circuit mediation inquiry.
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/20/2014	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	follow up re outstanding discovery
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/28/2014	111C		7.80	2,730.00	Y	review Deeds of Trust
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/01/2014	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	continue DOT review (3.3); meet with IT to see if there is a scanning program that would work to shorten review time (.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/03/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	prepare for and attend hearing on motion for discretionary review of certification order (.6); continue discovery review of deeds of trust (1.5); conference with co-counsel re objection to format of production of electronic deeds of trust (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/04/2014	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	continue review of deeds of trust (1.8); prepare for and attend teleconference with 9th circuit mediator (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2014	111C		1.90	665.00	Y	continue to review DOTs (1); draft ESI/30b6 language (.9)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/08/2014	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue to review DOTs (1.4); research re changes to Fannie form 3048 (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/15/2014	111C		1.40	490.00	Y	continue to review dot's
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/16/2014	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	continue DOT review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/18/2014	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	review order on motion for DR (.7); continue to review DOTs and research re: hiring third party to review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/20/2014	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	continue reviewing DOT and consult w/third party to review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/22/2014	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	continue DOT reviewing and coordinate files for third party review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/23/2014	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	continue reviewing DOT and coordinate process for third party review
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/29/2014	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	work with contractor to facilitate review of DOTs
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/06/2015	111C		4.80	1,680.00	Y	review declarations (1.2); prepare for and meet with amber Benson (4.1); conference with co counsel re status (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/07/2015	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	draft update email to client
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/09/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	email to client re status (.1); continue DOT reviews and coordination with co-counsel (2.4)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/13/2015	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Continue DOT review; meet with independent contractor that did review and start work on review of her findings
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/14/2015	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Office conference w/R. Siderius re: strategy (.5) DOT review and analysis of non-3048 DOTs (1.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/15/2015	111C		3.90	1,365.00	Y	Continue conducting DOT review and analysis
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/16/2015	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Research for forthcoming motions for summary judgment/ 61.24 and receivership statute;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/16/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft motion to modify commissioner ruling
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/19/2015	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Draft summary judgment memo (.8); conference with co counsel; work re response to motion to modify (3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/21/2015	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	research and memo re summary judgment issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/22/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	conference re summary judgment arguments
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/28/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	review answer to motion to modify
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/03/2015	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	review defendants reply re motion to modify (1); office conference with L. Lewis re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/09/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Teleconference with M. Daudt, coordinate re grant of review re removal
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/10/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	work re appeal filings and coordinate to attend oral arg
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/11/2015	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	review and revise stipulated joint motion (.3); work re coordinating filings with court for briefings and oral argument (2.5); various emails to and from opposing counsel re same (.1); review decision from state court of appeals (.6)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/12/2015	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	research re hearing on remand/removal
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/13/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	draft 30b6 notices
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/18/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	conf with co-counsel re appeal response,review draft of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/24/2015	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	Review omitted info from subpoena to MSI
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/24/2015	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Review deficiencies in MSI subpoena
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/25/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	prep for hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/26/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Continue to prep for 9th Cir. hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/26/2015	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Compile deficiency memorandum re subpoena to MSI
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/28/2015	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Continue prep for 9th Cir. hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/02/2015	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	prepare for hearing 9th circuit
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/03/2015	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	prep for hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/04/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Continue to prep for hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/05/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	prepare for hearing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/07/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	prepare for oral argument
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/08/2015	111C		12.00	4,200.00	Y	prepare for argument (4); travel to San Francisco (8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/09/2015	111C		14.00	4,900.00	Y	prepare for, attend oral argument (4); travel from San Fran to Wenatchee (8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/31/2015	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	work re case management conference scheduling
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/06/2015	111C		3.10	1,085.00	Y	Research re: appeal of 9th circuit decision (1.9); continue reviewing deficiencies in MSI subpoena (2.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/08/2015	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Teleconference with FAS counsel re subpoena (.6); review cases re post certification removal (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/09/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review 9th circuit decision (.8); teleconference with co-counsel re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/14/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Teleconference with opposing party re JSTand create memorandum re same

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/20/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	prepare for and attend JSR teleconference (1.5); draft proposed language re same (.8); email to opposing party re same; teleconference with co-counsel re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/21/2015	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Teleconference with M. Daudt re: motions on enforcement
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/22/2015	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Draft JSR and review scheduling issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/25/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Revise JSR
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/26/2015	111C		2.85	997.50	Y	Revise JSR issues (2.75); teleconference with opposing party re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/27/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Research RCW 7.28 claim
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/27/2015	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Continue researching JSR issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/28/2015	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Revise JSR (2); teleconference with clerk re scheduling conf issues (.4); draft Response to opposing party MSJ (2.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/29/2015	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Office conference w/ L. Lewis re: MSJ (.5); teleconference with co-counsel re same (3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/30/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	review statement of facts and J. Knox declaration documents
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/31/2015	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	review opposing party supporting docs re motion for PSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/01/2015	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Revise response to opposing party MPSJ (4.2) office conference w/ M Green, J. Aylward re: same (1.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/02/2015	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	research re possession issue (.7); office conference with M. Green and L. Lewis re Response (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/03/2015	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	legal research re issue of possession
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/04/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	legal research re recent US Supreme Court Class Action decisions and their relevance to pending action

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/05/2015	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	legal research re RCW 7.60 issues (.9); prepare for and attend scheduling conference (2.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/08/2015	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	draft response to MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/08/2015	111C		7.20	2,520.00	Y	Continue draft response to MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/09/2015	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Continue drafting response to MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/10/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	work re Response to MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/11/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Revise response
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/12/2015	111C		5.10	1,785.00	Y	work re Response
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/15/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Continue revising Response
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/16/2015	111C		6.80	2,380.00	Y	Review and revise response
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/17/2015	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	finalize response, draft decl, finalize statement of facts
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/18/2015	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Revise plaintiff's motion for summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/25/2015	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Continue revising plaintiffs MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/06/2015	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Research re pre-default damages (3.5); office conference w/ D. Gray (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/07/2015	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue drafting MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/08/2015	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Revise MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/09/2015	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	Continuing revising MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/10/2015	111C		4.30	1,505.00	Y	Continuing revising MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/11/2015	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Continuing revising MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/12/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Continuing revising MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/13/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Draft C. Gatens declaration and statement of specific facts re MPSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/14/2015	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	finalize and prepare for filing all MPSJ pleadings
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/20/2015	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Prepare for MPSJ oral argument prep (.1); office conference w/ R. Siderius (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/21/2015	111C		4.40	1,540.00	Y	Office conference w/ D. Gray re: reply (.8); draft same (3.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/22/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	office conference re reply (2.3); research re same (1.7)

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/23/2015	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Research re reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/24/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Office conference re: reply (.5)research re: same (3.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/27/2015	111C		5.20	1,820.00	Y	finalize and file reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/29/2015	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	prepare for hearing (5); drive to Spokane (3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/30/2015	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	prepare for and attend hearing (5); drive back from Spokane (3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/10/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	review order re motion for sj (.8); communication with co counsel re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/12/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Research steps needed to take regarding certification to supreme court (.8); teleconference with co counsel (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/13/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Research re supreme court appeal procedures (.4); teleconference with co-counsel re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/17/2015	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Research [REDACTED] (.5); email to opposing party re same (.2); office conference w/ R. Siderius re: mediation (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/18/2015	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	research re foreclosure of Jordan home, teleconference with opposing party re same (.5); office conference w/D. Gray, L. Lewis re: Sup. Ct argument (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/25/2015	111C		2.25	787.50	Y	research re: amici brief participants
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/26/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Teleconference with co-counsel re amici brief (.8); draftopening brief (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/27/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/28/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	work re opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/31/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/01/2015	111C		7.20	2,520.00	Y	Office conferences w/ D. Gray re opening brief (1.7); draft same (5.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/02/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Review and revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/03/2015	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	work re opening brief

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/04/2015	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/07/2015	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/08/2015	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/09/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Revise opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/10/2015	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	work re opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/11/2015	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Continue revisions to opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/14/2015	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Research re: opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/15/2015	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Continue revisions to opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/16/2015	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	finalize and file opening brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/29/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	review motion and affidavit re extended response deadline (.8); office conference w/S. White re: same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/02/2015	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	email to client re status
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/27/2015	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	draft letter re: reply extension (.3); teleconference with co-counsel re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/28/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	office conference w L. Lewis re motion to extend (.3) research re: same (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/29/2015	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Draft response brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/30/2015	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	prepare for and attend phone conf. with w/ L. Lewis, co counsel re reply to response (1.5); create outline (1.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/02/2015	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Draft and revise Reply outline
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/03/2015	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Revise Reply (4.5); teleconference with M. Green, L. Lewis, co-counsel re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/04/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Revise Reply outline (2.); teleconference with co counsel re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/05/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	conference with co counsel re reply brief (.2); work re amicus parties (1.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/06/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Research in support of reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/09/2015	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Revise reply (2.2); research and analysis re GAO reports (.6); Zombie property reports (.2); and string cite cases state laws (.2)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/10/2015	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	Revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/11/2015	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/12/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/13/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	legal research and review of vacant property ordinances reports
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/16/2015	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Continue research in support of Reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/17/2015	111C		6.30	2,205.00	Y	Office conference w/ L. Lewis re: draft reply (1); review and revise same (5.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/18/2015	111C		8.10	2,835.00	Y	Research and draft reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/19/2015	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	draft reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/20/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	draft and revise reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/24/2015	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Teleconference with Joe Brown re his lockout experience
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/25/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Draft and revise response to amici briefing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/30/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Review amici brief and issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/01/2015	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Teleconference with B. Chandler re amici brief, email to co-counsel re meeting dates, email with M. Daudt
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/08/2015	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Draft and revise response to amici brief re: issues from Freddie and COS
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/09/2015	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	review Memo from AG; coordinate with co-counsel re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/10/2015	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Research and draft response to AG Memo
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/11/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft COS amici brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/13/2015	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	review Fannie amicus brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/14/2015	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	conf call with co counsel re amici response (.3); work re COS receivership petitions (1.); teleconference with COS attorney re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/21/2015	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft re amicus reply, speak with J. Garfarious

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/23/2015	111C		1.85	647.50	Y	Research re amicus reply issues and research re muni codes
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/28/2015	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Draft re amicus brief reply outline
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/30/2015	111C		6.40	2,240.00	Y	Legal research re history of Freddie covenants
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/31/2015	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Research re amicus brief response and legal research re Freddie covenants
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/04/2016	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Draft amicus reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/05/2016	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Draft amici reply
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/06/2016	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Draft reply brief and declaration
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/07/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft and revise amici response and declaration
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/08/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	prep for oral arg
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/11/2016	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	oral arg prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/12/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	prepare for and argue mock oral argument;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/13/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	prepare for oral argument
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/15/2016	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	travel to and from Seattle for mock arguments (5); attend same (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/17/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	prep for oral argument
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/18/2016	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	drive to Olympia (2.0); prep for oral arguments (6.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/19/2016	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	prep for and attend oral argument (5.0); drive back to Wenatchee (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/25/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	emails to and from Laura re status
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/28/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	update to Laura (.3); review pending cases on similar issues around the country (1.4); follow up with class members that have called in (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/07/2016	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	review decision (1.2); coordinate with co-counsel re same (2.0); review rules re motions for reconsideration (2.0); mandate of opinion and next steps in district court (1.4); consult w M. Green (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/08/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	draft letter to client re decision; work re next steps

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/12/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	research re [REDACTED] (1.3); draft correspondence to A. Gibbons re same (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/14/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	work re retaining expert witness (1.6); teleconference with A. Gibbons re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/20/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Expert witness engagement and scope (.8); reviset letter to A. Gibbons re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/21/2016	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	review order on motions for summary judgment (.5); review pleadings re same and consult w/ L. Lewis re: same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/25/2016	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	work re discovery to be issued now that stay is lifted (1.0); teleconference with co counsel re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/28/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	review motion for reconsideration (.2); respond to email from amicus brief (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/08/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	review motions and brief for amici (1.5); teleconference and emails with Blythe re response to same; (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/09/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review objection to amici (.2); work re response to motion for reconsideration in fed dist court (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/09/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Teleconference with opposing party re stay issues (.2); email to co counsel re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/10/2016	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	review supplemental discovery and RFPs to Defendants
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/23/2016	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Draft 26f report
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/24/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	continue draft of 26f (1.7); teleconference with co counsel re same (.2); email to opposing party re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/25/2016	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	prepare for and attend 26f conference (.3); make revisions to 26f report re same (1.3)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/26/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	finalize 26f report; file same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/30/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	review denial of motion for reconsideration (.4); coordinate with co counsel re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/02/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Research on and emails with co-counsel re one way intervention issue
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/07/2016	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	coordinate with co counsel on one way intervention issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/08/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review motion to intervene (.8); conf with co counsel re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/09/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Research text and legislative history of ██████████
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/09/2016	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	prepare for and attend 26f conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/12/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Research re preemption issues (1.0); work re discovery response objections (1.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/20/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	draft updated initial disclosure
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/20/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	draft and circulate revisions to class notice
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/21/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Draft and conferences re opposition to motion to intervene
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/27/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review and revise stipulated protective order and entry of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/28/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Coordinate with opp counsel re filing of stipulated protective order (.2); coordinate with co-counsel re case management (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/29/2016	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	further coordination with opp counsel re stipulated protective order filing
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/30/2016	111C		4.20	1,470.00	Y	Review reply re motion to intervene (.3); prepare for and attend case management conference with co-counsel (2.1); review discovery produced re internal records for preservation services ordered and paid (1.8)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2016	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Review response to class notice (.3); emails to co counsel re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2016	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	Review discovery produced in prep for issuing new discovery requests
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/04/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review and draft re: 30(b)6 deposition notices
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/05/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Continue to draft and revise re 30(b)6 deposition notices
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/06/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Continue to draft and revise re 30(b)6 notices
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/07/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review and comment on class notice and revisions to proposed notice
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/10/2016	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Finalize and file reply re class notice
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/11/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Conduct discovery review and email re same to co-counsel and re 30(b)6 response
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/12/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Conduct discovery review and organization for sharing with co-counsel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/13/2016	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	Teleconference with J. Knox re 30(b)6 deposition notices
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/14/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	coordinate with co-counsel re 30(b)6 deposition timing; review decision on motion to intervene
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/17/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	prepare for and attend teleconference re 30(b)6 notice and timing for production of a designees
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/17/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	research re preemption case law
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/24/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review Defendants objection to 30(b)6 deposition notices
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/25/2016	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	prepare for and attend phone conference with co counsel re deposition scheduling and responses to deposition notice objections (.6); emails to opposing party re same (.15)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/27/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	prep for meet and confer re objections to deposition notice

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/28/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	prepare for and meet re deposition responses and objections
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/02/2016	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	review stip and order re motion to de cert briefing schedule
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/03/2016	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	work re stip and order re briefing schedule
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/09/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	emails re deposition scheduling and locations (.3); continue research re legislative amendment and impact on pending litigation (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/14/2016	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Coordinate deposition scheduling and hearing on motion to decert
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/16/2016	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	review motion to decertify and motion re preemption; teleconference with co counsel re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/17/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	legal research re preemption case law
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/18/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	prepare for and attend conference call with Gibbons re damages opinion (1.5); teleconference with Mike re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/21/2016	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Teleconference w/ Anthony with NWJP re FHFA intervention issues (.5); research FHFA intervention issues (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/21/2016	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Legal research re preemption cases
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/22/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	legal research re preemption MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/23/2016	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Research preemption MSJ issues (.5); research need for 30(b)6 deposition, conference call with co- counsel re same (.5); draft 30(b)6 deposition notice and correspondence to OP (2.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/26/2016	111C		4.10	1,435.00	Y	Deposition prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/27/2016	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Deposition prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/28/2016	111C		10.00	3,500.00	Y	drive to Seattle and fly to San Fran for Mousseau deps (9.5); continue prep for depositions (.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/29/2016	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Take Mousseau deposition (7.5); work re subpoenas and follow up to that deposition (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/30/2016	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Prepare for Strittmatter and Loll depositions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/01/2016	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	travel from San Fran for Strittmatter and Loll deposition (7.5); prep for same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/02/2016	111C		14.00	4,900.00	Y	Take Strittmatter and Loll depositions (8.0); travel from Dallas to Seattle (6.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/03/2016	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	travel from Seattle to Wenatchee
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2016	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Draft response to email from opposing party re outstanding deposition items and issues (.4); consult w/ S. White re case status (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/07/2016	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Draft discovery and deposition response letter to M. Sullivan;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/08/2016	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	legal research and review of HERA legislative history
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/12/2016	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	coordinate discussion re discovery response and issues (.3); emails with co-counsel re FNMA motion stipulation (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/13/2016	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	conference call with co-counsel re discovery responses and additional requests, timing of response to motion to decert and seek of stay, and research re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/14/2016	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	respond to call re SDT from Cyrprexx; draft second discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/15/2016	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft Response to FHFA motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/15/2016	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Draft discovery requests; prepare for and attend meet and confer conference; teleconference with co counsel re same

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/16/2016	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	Teleconference with Goldberger re Cyprex SDT (.6); Teleconference with co counsel re stipulation on briefing schedules and work re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/22/2016	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	prepare for and attend meet and confer with opposing party re Cyprex and Safeguard SDT's
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/05/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Review and revise Reply to FHFA MSJ (5.0); meet with co-counsel re same (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/06/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Review HERA research and Response on FHFA MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/09/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Draft and revise Response to FHFA motion
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/19/2017	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	Review SDT responses from Safeguard
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/19/2017	111C		4.70	1,645.00	Y	Draft final edits to Response to FHA motion (1.2); review notice of AG motion to file amici (1.3); draft and revise declaration and all exhibits in support of Response (2.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/23/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Work re dep scheduling and follow up on SDT responses from Safeguard
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/26/2017	111C		1.40	490.00	Y	review SDT responses from MCS (1.2); email with co counsel re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/30/2017	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Correspond w/ Laura on case status
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/31/2017	111C		1.35	472.50	Y	Review discovery productions and objections (.8); sort ██████████ (██████████) (.3); review and comment on AG brief with co-counsel (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/01/2017	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	Coordinate Dallas depositions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/13/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Coordinate attendance at legislative hearings (1.0); drive to Olympia re same (4.0); prepare for same (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/15/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Make calls to non-enterprise class members

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/18/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review discovery productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/24/2017	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Prepare for and attend meet and confer re discovery responses and objections
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/27/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Work re responses to Def's first set of discovery requests; coordinate same with co-counsel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/27/2017	111C		1.30	455.00	Y	Work re damage calcs for fair rental value; research re Howard v. Edgren case
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/28/2017	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Teleconference with [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (1.0); coordinate with co counsel re MCS productions (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/02/2017	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Draft [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/09/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Review decision on FHFA motion for SJ (1.5); telephone conf. with Co counsel re same (.4); email to OC re scheduling moving (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/13/2017	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Draft and revise responses to defendant discovery requests (1.0); email with co counsel re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/14/2017	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	Teleconference to OC re outstanding responses (.25); view senate hearing on SB 5960 (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/28/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Review MCS productions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/29/2017	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Continue to follow up with A. Noble re status of outstanding discovery productions and 30B1 deps
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/04/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Teleconference and emails with Mike re meet and confer re Plaintiff's discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/05/2017	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Review [REDACTED] case(.5); email to co-counsel re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/10/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review draft Response to FHFA Motion to Certify Appeal

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/19/2017	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	Revise motion to compel (.6); conference with CC re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/24/2017	111C		1.30	455.00	Y	Prepare for depositions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/25/2017	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Review discovery productions from FAS and MSI in prep for upcoming deps
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/25/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Review SDT productions from MCS, Safeguard, and FAS in prep for deps
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/26/2017	111C		2.30	805.00	Y	Work on dep outlines (2.0); office conference w/ D. Gray, M. Hitchcock, M. green re: rental value (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/29/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Prep for deps; assemble exhibits
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/29/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Prepare for deps
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/30/2017	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Deposition prep and exhibit organization
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/30/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Prepare for deps
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/01/2017	111C		10.00	3,500.00	Y	Travel to Seattle to meet with A. Gibbons (3.0); meet with A. Gibbons and co-counsel (2.5); deposition prep (4.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/02/2017	111C		9.00	3,150.00	Y	Travel to Dallas (5.0); prep for deps (4.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/03/2017	111C		8.50	2,975.00	Y	Take dep of J. Burgess (6.5); draft notes and updates to co-counsel re additional discovery requests (2.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/04/2017	111C		13.50	4,725.00	Y	Prepare for dep (1.); travel to and attend dep of R. Donahue (3.0.); travel back to Seattle (6.5) travel back to Wenatchee (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/05/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Teleconference with co-counsel re dep and outstanding discovery issues (1.); work re expert witness issues and analysis re rental values (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/05/2017	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	Review declaration instructions to A. Gibbons
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/10/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Draft letter to OC re outstanding 30Bg witness topics

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/11/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Contact ██████████ and speak with reps re same (.5); call with co-counsel re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/24/2017	111C		1.45	507.50	Y	Review second notice of deposition(.3); teleconference with J. Knox re same (.35); review LRs; FRCP; and RPC re same(.5); draft letter to OC re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/25/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Work on Response to Motion to Decertify (5.0); work regarding expert witness testimony and ██████████ (1.0).
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/05/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Phone conference with co-counsel re outstanding discovery issues and absent class member depositions
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/06/2017	111C		1.10	385.00	Y	Teleconference with ██████████ (.5); Teleconference with co counsel re same and re additional discovery requests (.3); begin resolving same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/08/2017	111C		0.85	297.50	Y	Review ██████████ (.5); communicate with co-counsel re same (.35)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/08/2017	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Draft update email to Laura Jordan
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/08/2017	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Teleconference with co counsel and ██████████ (.5); work with property preservation services excel sheet to determine first dates of lock changes (1.7)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/08/2017	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	Respond to email from client
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/14/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Review LR37(e) letter from OP and review cited cases (.5); teleconference with Co Counsel re same (.25)

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/15/2017	111C		3.25	1,137.50	Y	Multiple calls ██████████ (1.5); work on class list data production (.85); calls and emails with co -counsel re same (.9)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/19/2017	111C		1.15	402.50	Y	Teleconference and emails with co-counsel ██████████ (.5); research re ██████████ (.65)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/22/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Draft outline for oral argument
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/26/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Research case law on restitution of unjust enrichment(2.0); continued emails and discussions re expert witness testimony and rental value calculations (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/27/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Prepare for oral argument & draft outline (3.0); drive to Spokane for hearing (3.)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/28/2017	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Prepare for oral argument (2.0); attend same (2.0); meet with Co counsel re same (1.0); drive back home (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/29/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Research re statutory trespass cases
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/10/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Work re response to SJ re statutory trespass claim (1.0); work re Greenfield scope of services and engagement (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/11/2017	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Call with co counsel re expert witness engagement (.4); call with a. Gibbons re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/11/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Begin drafting response to MSJ on statutory trespass
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/12/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Continue drafting response to MSJ re statutory trespass
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/13/2017	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Prepare for and take deposition of A.J. Loll (4.5); teleconference with Co counsel re same (.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/18/2017	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	Review [REDACTED] and search public records for same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/20/2017	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Review pleadings and testimony re payment of corporate advances (2.75); draft email to co counsel re same (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/25/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Attend phone conference with co counsel re expert witness analysis and data (1.0); review discovery productions re [REDACTED] (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/26/2017	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Review expert draft report (.4); email to co counsel re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/01/2017	111C		1.60	560.00	Y	Draft amended initial disclosure and damage calculations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/15/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Prepare for and attend meet and confer with OC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/16/2017	111C		1.65	577.50	Y	Review and respond to email regarding expert witness deadlines from OC (.4); draft RFA re class list productions (1.15)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/17/2017	111C		1.80	630.00	Y	Draft RFAs (1.0) and respond to OC re deadline extension request (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/22/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review response to motion to expedite and motion for leave to supplement
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/22/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Review motion to extend and all supporting declarations (.5); review motion and declarations re motion for leave re suppl. brief (.5); teleconference and email with co counsel re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/24/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Conference call with co-counsel re response to motion to expedite and motion to supplement.
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/29/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Draft revisions to response to motion to extend deadlines

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/29/2017	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Work on draft of 30(b)(6) notice re authentication of documents and lists
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/31/2017	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Finalize 30b6 authentication dep notice (.6); review final drafts and declarations in opposition to motion to extend (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/06/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Review order on motion for decert (.5); discuss same with co-counsel (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/06/2017	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Follow up and send formal 30b6 dep notices setting 9/16 dep date
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/07/2017	111C		14.00	4,900.00	Y	Drive to Seattle (3.0); attend dep of Kilpatrick (8.0); drive home (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/18/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Emails and teleconference with Co counsel re expert supplemental report issues
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/19/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Prepare for and attend teleconference with OC re 30B6 dep objections (.5); consult with co-counsel re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/20/2017	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Teleconference with Court Clerk re LR 37 conference request(.25); draft letter to Judge re same (2.75).
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/21/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Send draft of LR 37 letter to co-counsel (.2); revise and edit same and file same with Court (1.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/22/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Prepare for and attend discovery conference with the Court (1.0); prepare for 30b6 statutory trespass deps(1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/25/2017	111C		0.85	297.50	Y	Work re defendant expert dep issues and re-scheduling of same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/27/2017	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Work re end dates for 579 properties with [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/28/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Teleconference conferences with CC re dep and case scheduling (.75); discussions re settlement terms (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/29/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review emails and coordinate re dep and case schedules and mediation

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2017	111C		0.80	280.00	Y	Work re dep schedules (.4); review and respond to bankruptcy borrower late disclosures (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/04/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Review revised list of loans without end dates (.5); test searches on county websites re same and sort list by county and assign process and research to paralegal (2.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/05/2017	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Attend phone conference with Greenfield and Assoc. - Randy re loan history analysis
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/05/2017	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Review and analyze research and summary of issues with Defendant's expert witness rebuttal statements
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/10/2017	111C		1.75	612.50	Y	Review and provide corrections and analysis to 379 [REDACTED] and supporting documentation
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/10/2017	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Work re settlement responses options; email to OC re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/10/2017	111C		8.85	3,097.50	Y	Prepare for and attend meet and confer regarding discovery responses (2.0); review discovery productions in prep for 30b6 depositions (6.85)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/11/2017	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Finalize chart of [REDACTED] analysis and em to co counsel re same (.6); review comment history loan file productions (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/17/2017	111C		1.50	525.00	Y	Prepare for and attend conference call with co-counsel re trial prep tasks and deadlines
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/25/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Prepare for 30B6 depositions of Burgess and Ehinger
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/25/2017	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Prepare and take 30B6 depositions of Burgess and Ehinger (3.0); work re deposition designations (6.0)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/26/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Work re trial dep designations and exhibit list(5.0); teleconference with co counsel re MSJ reply (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/27/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Mark dep designations and exhibits
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/28/2017	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Designate dep testimony
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/30/2017	111C		5.80	2,030.00	Y	Work re dep designations (2.0); work re revisions to Reply and response to statement of undisputed facts (3.0); review and approve dep in support of MSJ Reply (.3); emails with co counsel re mediation (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/31/2017	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Designate trial exhibits (3.0); emails with co-counsel re mediation options (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/02/2017	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Work re witness list and descriptions (2.0); work re borrower history file review for pre-2012 class members
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/06/2017	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Review and designate Burgess deposition (1.2); review and designate Ehinger deposition (1.5); email to co counsel re same and prep and attend teleconference with co counsel re exhibit list and pre-trial issues (1.5); work re same (2.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/07/2017	111C		6.20	2,170.00	Y	Finalize and file dep designations, exhibit list, and witness list (4.0); review SJ pleadings and prep for oral arg re same (2.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/08/2017	111C		1.80	630.00	Y	Prepare for mediation (.5); review defendant's witness list, exhibits, and dep designations (1.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/09/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Prep for hearing on MSJ(1.5); draft witness objections and supporting declarations (1.0)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/13/2017	111C		6.35	2,222.50	Y	Finalize draft of Objections to Defendant's Witnesses (2.0); provide instructions re brief outline (1.0); review objections to Defendant's proposed exhibits (.5); prepare for and attend call with mediator (.75); prepare for oral argument on MPSJ (2.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/14/2017	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Drive to Spokane for oral argument (3.0); prepare for oral argument (5.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/15/2017	111C		7.50	2,625.00	Y	Prepare for oral argument (2.5); attend oral argument (2.0); drive home from oral argument (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/16/2017	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Post hearing follow up and teleconference with co counsel(.5); work re mediation brief (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/16/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Work on loan collection histories and changes to rental value damage calculations (1.25); give instruction re mediation brief content and damage calcs (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/19/2017	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Draft revisions to mediation brief
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/20/2017	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Draft revisions to mediation brief and review and coordinate re expert rental damage value updates
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/21/2017	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Prepare for and attend teleconference with CC re mediation brief (1.0); work re calculation of rental value damages (1.0); draft final revisions to mediation brief and submit (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/21/2017	111C		1.30	455.00	Y	Review Order on MPSJ and revise mediation letter accordingly
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/22/2017	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Finalize mediation brief and damage calculations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/25/2017	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Review and organize all mediation support materials and run various damage calculations in prep for mediation

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/26/2017	111C		4.60	1,610.00	Y	Review all 30(b)(6) deps in prep for mediation
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/27/2017	111C		14.00	4,900.00	Y	Travel to Seattle for mediation (3.0); prepare for and attend mediation (8.0); travel home (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/30/2017	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Draft revisions to pretrial order, exhibit and witness list, coordinate re same and filing of same and prepare for pretrial conference
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2017	111C		6.50	2,275.00	Y	Prepare for pre-trial conference and related trial prep matters; multiple emails and teleconference with co-counsel re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/05/2017	111C		4.00	1,400.00	Y	Prepare for and attend legislative meeting on foreclosure statute legislative proposed changes
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/06/2017	111C		9.00	3,150.00	Y	Travel to Seattle for hearing (3.0); prepare for and attend hearing (3.0); return from Seattle (3.0)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/07/2017	111C		8.00	2,800.00	Y	Trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/08/2017	111C		7.00	2,450.00	Y	Trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/11/2017	111C		9.80	3,430.00	Y	Trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/12/2017	111C		10.50	3,675.00	Y	Trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/13/2017	111C		11.90	4,165.00	Y	Trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/14/2017	111C		14.00	4,900.00	Y	Travel to and from Seattle to meet and prep expert (6.0); meet with and prep expert (3.5); continue trial prep and testifying witness outlines (4.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/15/2017	111C		12.60	4,410.00	Y	Trial prep and settlement negotiations
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/31/2017	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Review and draft comments and revisions to settlement agreement draft
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/02/2018	111C		2.40	840.00	Y	Review and draft revisions to SA
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/02/2018	111C		2.00	700.00	Y	Attend legislative conference on FFA proposed legislation

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/16/2018	111C		1.95	682.50	Y	Review and revise long form notice form (.6); research options for handling bankruptcy class members per questions from OC (.6); draft further revisions to proposed legislative language for allowing limited pre foreclosure entries (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/17/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Teleconference with CC re bankruptcy class members and settlement agreement draft to OC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/25/2018	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Review GCG claims admin bid and discuss same with CC
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/31/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status meeting
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/05/2018	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	Review revisions to settlement agreement from OC (1.3); review notes and emails from settlement re scope of release (.75); conference call with CC re same (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/08/2018	111C		6.00	2,100.00	Y	Research overlapping class case law and orders (3.5); draft outline and notes re response to settlement agreement revisions generally and scope of release (2.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/12/2018	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Emails and calls with CC re settlement agreement proposed changes from NS (.3); follow up OC re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/12/2018	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Emails and calls with CC re settlement agreement proposed changes from NS (.3); follow up OC re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/13/2018	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	Attend weekly meeting on case status and give instructions re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/14/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Conference with CC re additional mediation (.25); draft email to OC re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/20/2018	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Draft letter re mediation position

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/21/2018	111C		3.95	1,382.50	Y	continue draft letter re mediation position(3.2); multiple emails with co counsel re same (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/21/2018	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Review all comments re mediation draft and revise same (2.5); finalize same and submit to mediator (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	02/27/2018	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Conference call with B. Terrell re case status and next steps
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/02/2018	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Prepare for and attend mediation conference (2.0); follow up emails and calls with CC re same
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/13/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status conference and give instructions re same(.4); emails to Co counsel re potential trial dates (.25); emails to OC re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/15/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Draft email to mediator re status and contact with the court (.25); emails with CC re same (.25);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/20/2018	111C		2.20	770.00	Y	Review and respond to notice questions from claims admin (.5); review and draft revisions to discovery confirming letter (1.2); give instructions to DAG re scheduling of discovery motions re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/22/2018	111C		1.45	507.50	Y	Review and respond to emails from mediator re call (.25); prepare for and attend same (.5); draft letter to co counsel re same (.3); finalize letter to Court re scheduling conference and transmit same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/23/2018	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Prepare for and attend phone conference with OC re settlement issues (1.15); draft email to CC re summary of same (.65)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/27/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Emails with OC re meet and confer re trial scheduling (.25); emails with CC re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/28/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status and scheduling meeting
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	03/29/2018	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Circulate and coordinate with CC and OC re trial dates (.4); draft email to Court re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/06/2018	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	Teleconference with OC re settlement issues (.5); email to co counsel re same (.25); review motion for second class notice (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/16/2018	111C		5.10	1,785.00	Y	Legal research re claims splitting analysis (3.2); conferences with CC re same and re structure of motion for PSJ from Plaintiff (1.9)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/17/2018	111C		1.85	647.50	Y	Prepare and attend teleconference with mediator re continued mediation efforts (1.2); review and respond to Safeguard intervenor pleadings (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/18/2018	111C		2.80	980.00	Y	Legal research re claims splitting case law and analysis as it relates to arguments for a second class notice
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	04/25/2018	111C		3.00	1,050.00	Y	Prepare for (2.5) and attend oral argument on second class notice (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/02/2018	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status meeting
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/03/2018	111C		1.20	420.00	Y	Review order on class notice (.4); review proposed notice to trustees and make comments re same (.5); email to CC re trustee search and notice revisions (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/04/2018	111C		2.30	805.00	Y	Teleconference with mediator (.5); teleconference with CC re same (.3); work re notice to trustee and trustee search (1.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/08/2018	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Teleconference with CC re trustee notice issues and mediation responses (.5); review and revise trustee search (.25); email to OC re class notice revisions (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/09/2018	111C		1.85	647.50	Y	Review and revise trustee notice spreadsheet (1.5); emails to CC re same and mailings from same (.35)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/18/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review final notice to BK trustees and check on status of mailings (.25); email to OC re status of same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/25/2018	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Case status call with co-counsel
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	05/31/2018	111C		1.25	437.50	Y	Attend phone conference re settlement status with mediator (.75); teleconference with CC re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/05/2018	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status and strategy meeting
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/06/2018	111C		0.25	87.50	Y	Call with CC re mediation status and trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/07/2018	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Follow up with mediator (.25); continue trial prep (2.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/14/2018	111C		1.75	612.50	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status and strategy meeting (.4); prepare for and attend call with CC re trial Prep (.6); create matrix and check list for reviewing individual loan files (.75);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/15/2018	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Review individual loan files for trial prep (3.0); give instruction to paralegals re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/21/2018	111C		4.60	1,610.00	Y	Prepare for and attend pre trial call with CC and OC (.6); teleconference with CC re same following Call (.75); review supplemental discovery productions re summary exhibits (1.5); continue review and coordination of all individual loan files 1.75

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/25/2018	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	Review and make revisions to pre-trial order
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/27/2018	111C		3.60	1,260.00	Y	Review Defendant's trial brief; draft notes and outline re same (3.6);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/28/2018	111C		3.30	1,155.00	Y	Continue review of Defendant and FHFA trial brief and make notes and outlines re same (3.3);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	06/29/2018	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Review Rangel dep for prep trail and notes and outline re same (2.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/01/2018	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Review P. Mousseau dep and make notes and trial outline of same (3.5);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/01/2018	111C		2.50	875.00	Y	Review Strittmatter dep and make notes and trial outline of same (2.5);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/02/2018	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Review AJ Loll dep and make notes and trial outline of same (4.5);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/03/2018	111C		3.80	1,330.00	Y	Review J. Burgess dep and make notes and trial outline of same (3.8);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/04/2018	111C		3.60	1,260.00	Y	Review and make edits to proposed pre trial order (1.1); review and draft revisions to trial brief and teleconference with CC re same (2.5);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/05/2018	111C		3.60	1,260.00	Y	Legal research re [REDACTED] (3.6);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/09/2018	111C		5.40	1,890.00	Y	Research [REDACTED] (1.5); review and draft revisions to pre-trial brief (3.6); emails with CC re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/09/2018	111C		3.20	1,120.00	Y	Review Defendant's second trial brief (1.0); review and make notes and trial prep outline of second AJ Loll dep (2.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/10/2018	111C		3.35	1,172.50	Y	Prepare for and attend trial prep and outstanding tasks meeting (.85); identify and designate sponsoring witness exhibits (2.5)

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/10/2018	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Teleconference with L. Peterson re settlement (.5); Teleconference with CC re same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/11/2018	111C		3.50	1,225.00	Y	Review and revise settlement agreement
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/12/2018	111C		5.00	1,750.00	Y	Continue trial prep (2.5); make further revisions to settlement agreement and emails with CC re same (.2.0); emails to OC and teleconference with OC re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/13/2018	111C		3.60	1,260.00	Y	Continue trial prep (3.1); teleconference with OC re settlement terms (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/16/2018	111C		4.50	1,575.00	Y	Trial prep and settlement negotiations (4.5);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/18/2018	111C		2.70	945.00	Y	Continue settlement negotiations [REDACTED] terms (2.7);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/19/2018	111C		6.30	2,205.00	Y	Prepare for pre trial conference and argument re motion in limine (1.5); attend same (.35); teleconference with CC re same and re settlement discussions (.75); multiple calls and email with OC re settlement terms (1.2); draft revisions to settlement agreement re opt-out and confidentiality (2.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/20/2018	111C		4.40	1,540.00	Y	Continue to negotiate final settlement terms with OC and CC (2.8); teleconference with client re same (.5); review and approve final draft of settlement agreement and emails to CC re same (.5); draft and file notice of settlement with court (.6).
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/26/2018	111C		1.85	647.50	Y	Review and make revisions to Motion for Prelim Approval and supporting declarations (1.85);

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/26/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for and attend case status and strategy meeting (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/30/2018	111C		3.40	1,190.00	Y	Review and draft revisions to motion for Prelim Approval (1.6); start draft declaration ISO same for Laura (1.4); review file and review Offer of Judgment from 2013 re same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	07/31/2018	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Prepare for (.3); and attend case status and pending task and motion assignment call with CC (.35)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/01/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for (.25) and attend weekly case status and task assignment meeting (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/01/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Call with CC re [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/02/2018	109B		0.20	70.00	Y	Teleconference with CC re status of settlement exhibits and [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/09/2018	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Prepare for (.25); and attend weekly case status, deadline, and task assignment meeting (.35)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/10/2018	111C		1.00	350.00	Y	Draft cy pres designee descriptions for motion for Prelim Approval (.5); draft same for NWJP (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/20/2018	111C		0.65	227.50	Y	Draft email to CC re [REDACTED] [REDACTED] (.65)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/23/2018	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	Review and provide comment on CAFA notice and letter from claims admin
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/24/2018	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Review and respond to emails from OC on CAFA notice (.2); emails with CC re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/29/2018	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Prepare for and attend weekly case status and strategy meeting

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	08/31/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review Nationstar's Response to motion for Prelim Approval
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/10/2018	111C		0.30	105.00	Y	Weekly case status and strategy meeting
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	09/21/2018	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Attend office conference with D. Gray re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/02/2018	111C		0.20	70.00	Y	Review email from claims admin re questions on data inputs (.1); em to CC re responses to same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/03/2018	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Attend meeting with D. Gray re: case status and strategy;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/17/2018	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Prepare for (.2) and attend Teleconference with CC and OC teleconference re claims process in advance of hearing with Court (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/17/2018	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Attend meeting with D. Gray re: case status and strategy (.1);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/18/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for call with Court and review revised notices (.2); attend call (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/22/2018	111C		0.55	192.50	Y	Prepare for call with CC by reviewing BK borrower excel calculations (.25); attend call with CC re same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/25/2018	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Attend office conference with D. Gray re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/31/2018	111C		0.60	210.00	Y	Teleconference with CC re update to Court re BK class member calculations (.3); place Teleconference calls to potential BK trustees to facilitate payments to BK class members (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/31/2018	111C		0.90	315.00	Y	Teleconference with Bruce Kriegman re engaging to help determine BK awards (.4); draft letter to same re same (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	10/31/2018	111C		0.20	70.00	Y	Attend meeting with D. Gray re: case status and strategy

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/01/2018	111C		0.70	245.00	Y	Draft further revisions to Supplemental notice to Court re BK class members (.3); draft email to CC re same (.2); draft email to OC re same (.3);
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/01/2018	111C		2.40	840.00	Y	Teleconference with trustee Mike Klien re motion to substitute (.5); review and revise engagement letter from B. Kriegman (.75); emails to CC re same (.3); draft revisions to Supplemental Notice to Court re input from Kriegman (.85)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/05/2018	111C		0.40	140.00	Y	Review revisions to Supplemental Report re post-petition lock change analysis (.2); email to and from CC re looking up bankruptcy dates (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/07/2018	111C		0.10	35.00	Y	Attend office conference with D. Gray re: case status and strategy;
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/26/2018	111C		0.75	262.50	Y	Review order for prelim approval (.5); give instructions re deadlines for same (.25)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	11/27/2018	109B		0.30	105.00	Y	Review website and notice form draft from claims admin (.2); email to CC re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/03/2018	111C		0.20	70.00	Y	Review and approve updated notice and IVR script
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/04/2018	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Prepare for and attend call with BK special master re process for paying out BK class member award
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	12/17/2018	111C		0.35	122.50	Y	Email to client re rental value damage recalculation (.3); email to CC re same (.05)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/04/2019	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review call in notes from class member ██████████ (.1); teleconference with ██████████ re class damages and awards questions (.2); draft email to CC re summary of same (.2)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/09/2019	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review draft motion for extension from B. Kriegman re bankruptcy analysis (.2); review and respond to emails with CC re same (.2); review weekly stats from claims admin (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	CMG	01/23/2019	111C		0.50	175.00	Y	Review and respond to email re class members, opt-outs, and motion for fees
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/01/2014	111C		2.25	517.50	Y	Research case law regarding [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/04/2014	111C		1.75	402.50	Y	Draft memo re: [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/04/2014	111C		4.25	977.50	Y	Finish researching and draft memo re: [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/07/2014	111C		1.50	345.00	Y	Continue researching [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/09/2015	111C		4.00	920.00	Y	Research validity of pre default contractual agreements for post default remedies.
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/09/2015	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Conference with C. Gatens re: Washington law re: pre default contract for post default remedies
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/10/2015	111C		2.00	460.00	Y	Research argument re: using contracts to avoid statutory requirements.
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/10/2015	111C		1.50	345.00	Y	Finish researching pre default contracting for post default remedies.
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/10/2015	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Draft memo re to C. Gatens: using contracts to avoid statutory requirements.
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/11/2015	111C		1.50	345.00	Y	Research case law re: statutory receivership is the exclusive remedy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/11/2015	111C		1.50	345.00	Y	Draft argument re: receivership statute is the exclusive remedy

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/11/2015	111C		1.34	308.20	Y	Research legislative history and purpose of the receivership statute
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/15/2015	111C		2.00	460.00	Y	Start reviewing and checking citations and formatting.
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/16/2015	111C		3.50	805.00	Y	Finish first revision of citations and formatting for response
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/23/2015	111C		0.25	57.50	Y	Revise citations in MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/24/2015	111C		1.42	326.60	Y	Research deed of trust and mortgage forms in Washington
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/29/2015	111C		2.67	614.10	Y	Research re: borrower's ability to give post default remedies pre default
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/30/2015	111C		3.75	862.50	Y	Research argument re: [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/01/2015	111C		1.75	402.50	Y	Research [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/02/2015	111C		0.33	75.90	Y	Draft memo re: UCC
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/02/2015	111C		1.33	305.90	Y	Finish researching arguments re: remedy is outside the scope of what can be granted pre default
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/06/2015	111C		0.70	161.00	Y	OC with C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/08/2015	111C		2.45	563.50	Y	Research for motion to dismiss, OC with C. Gatens, L. Lewis
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/10/2015	111C		1.30	299.00	Y	Research AG suits against property preservation companies
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/10/2015	111C		1.10	253.00	Y	Begin first round of edits
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/13/2015	111C		0.25	57.50	Y	Revise citations in motion for partial summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/14/2015	111C		2.40	552.00	Y	Revise citations and other edits for motion for summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/21/2015	111C		0.80	184.00	Y	OCs with C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/22/2015	111C		2.25	517.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens, L. Lewis, R. Siderius, B. Huber, M. Green re: reply to response to MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/24/2015	111C		4.75	1,092.50	Y	Research and draft license argument for reply to MSJ (4.25); office conference re: same (.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/24/2015	111C		0.75	172.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and L. Lewis
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/27/2015	111C		1.60	368.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and L. Lewis (.4); Research for Reply to Response to Jordan's MSJ (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/30/2015	111C		8.50	1,955.00	Y	Attend hearing re: cross motions for summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/13/2015	111C		1.25	287.50	Y	Research and draft memo re: Illinois AG suit and class action
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/18/2015	111C		0.75	172.50	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: issues certified to WA Supreme Court
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/26/2015	111C		0.75	172.50	Y	Begin research to support policy arguments
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/28/2015	111C		1.40	322.00	Y	Look for AG opinions, agency reports, news reports re: property preservation abuse
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/31/2015	111C		2.70	621.00	Y	Research re: other state forms and origin/history of 3048
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/01/2015	111C		3.10	713.00	Y	OC w/ C. Gatens (1.9) research re: municipalities requiring banks to restore abandoned property; evolution of form 3048 (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/02/2015	111C		2.20	506.00	Y	Draft portion of policy argument for C. Gatens review
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/02/2015	111C		1.20	276.00	Y	research re: policy argument, comb through discovery for versions of form 3048
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/03/2015	111C		0.10	23.00	Y	Research re: brief to WA supreme court
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/17/2016	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: preemption argument
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/16/2016	111C		1.80	414.00	Y	Conference with co-counsel
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/17/2016	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Research re: cases relating to preemption argument
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/18/2016	111C		1.25	287.50	Y	Read and analyze cases relevant to preemption argument
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/03/2016	111C		0.60	138.00	Y	Begin compiling HERA legislative history

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/08/2016	111C		0.20	46.00	Y	Research history of HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/10/2016	111C		0.90	207.00	Y	Research legislative history of HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/14/2016	111C		0.30	69.00	Y	Continue compiling legislative history of HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/15/2016	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Research legislative history of HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/16/2016	111C		2.70	621.00	Y	Continue compiling legislative history of HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/19/2016	111C		0.60	138.00	Y	Continue researching Legislative History of HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/20/2016	111C		0.30	69.00	Y	Teleconference w/ co-counsel re: HERA
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/23/2016	111C		0.20	46.00	Y	HERA Legislative Research: begin annotating compiled sources
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/03/2017	111C		0.60	138.00	Y	Research HERA Legislative History
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/06/2017	111C		1.90	437.00	Y	Research re: Response to Preemption Motion (1.4); office conference w/ C. Gatens re: [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/09/2017	111C		3.90	897.00	Y	Research re: various cases - [REDACTED] (.5); [REDACTED] (3.0); review response to preemption motion (.9)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/10/2017	111C		2.70	621.00	Y	Distill HERA Legislative History
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/11/2017	111C		6.30	1,449.00	Y	Research HERA Legislative History
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/12/2017	111C		7.20	1,656.00	Y	Finish working through HERA Legislative History
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/13/2017	111C		7.10	1,633.00	Y	Create and edit Legislative History Exhibit
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/16/2017	111C	WK	2.30	529.00	Y	Draft appendix of HERA Legislative History
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/17/2017	111C	WK	3.60	828.00	Y	Draft and revise response to FHFA Summ J
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/18/2017	111C	WK	3.10	713.00	Y	Review response to preemption motion and revise for C. Gatens review (2.8); teleconference w/ Co counsel (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/19/2017	111C	WK	4.98	1,145.40	Y	Draft, locate and organize exhibits to Response to MSJ

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/31/2017	111C		0.40	92.00	Y	Review AG Amicus Brief
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	02/22/2017	111C		1.90	437.00	Y	Research re: Perry Capital LLC v. Jacob Lew (10th Circuit FHFA Preemption Case)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	02/28/2017	111C		1.50	345.00	Y	Calls with Potential Class Representatives (.5); Research re: [REDACTED] (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	03/01/2017	111C		0.80	184.00	Y	Research re: [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	03/02/2017	111C		1.00	230.00	Y	Draft proposed [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/04/2017	111C		0.90	207.00	Y	Research re: cases discussing damages from property preservation fees
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/26/2017	111C		0.30	69.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: calculating rental value
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/23/2017	111C		1.00	230.00	Y	Review AG Complaints in response to public records request
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/25/2017	111C		1.00	230.00	Y	Work re: response to motion to decertify
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/01/2017	111C		0.20	46.00	Y	Review order re: interrogatories
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/08/2017	111C		0.10	23.00	Y	Email to Tony Scisciani re: subpoena duces tecum to Field Asset Services
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/30/2017	111C		1.00	0.00	Y	Review opposition's expert disclosure and reports (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/07/2017	111C		0.60	0.00	Y	Review order denying motion to decertify (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/26/2017	111C		0.10	23.00	Y	Emails re: deposition of Bates McKee
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/25/2017	111C		1.50	0.00	Y	Attend scienter deposition (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/30/2017	111C		2.00	0.00	Y	Research in support of reply (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/08/2017	111C		0.70	161.00	Y	Prepare for and attend meeting with C. Gatens re: strategy, case status, and mediation brief
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/10/2017	111C		0.10	23.00	Y	Begin drafting mediation brief

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/13/2017	111C		0.80	184.00	Y	Emails re: mediation submission (.2); office conference with C. Gatens re: same (.3); begin research re: Briseno v. ConAgra (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/14/2017	111C		4.90	1,127.00	Y	Work with C. Gatens to prepare for argument (1,7); help prepare summary judgment binder (.5); review pleadings in preparation for mediation brief (2.7)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/15/2017	111C		0.80	184.00	Y	Continue researching and drafting mediation submission (.1); office conference with C. Gatens re: summary judgment hearing (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/16/2017	111C		7.00	1,610.00	Y	Continue researching and drafting mediation submission
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/17/2017	111C		2.90	667.00	Y	Continue drafting and revising mediation submission (2.6); office conference with C. Gatens re: same (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/18/2017	111C		4.30	989.00	Y	Continue drafting, revising, and researching mediation submission
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/19/2017	111C		2.40	552.00	Y	Finalize Mediation Submission for C. Gatens review and comment (2.2); office conference with C. Gatens re: same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/20/2017	111C		1.60	368.00	Y	Locate deposition citations for mediation submission (.4); revise mediation submission (1,2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/21/2017	111C		0.90	207.00	Y	Review order on motion for partial summary judgment (.4); office conference with C. Gatens re: same and mediation submission (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/24/2017	111C		1.10	253.00	Y	Review final submission in preparation for mediation (.5); review Nationstar's Mediation Submission (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/25/2017	111C		0.10	23.00	Y	Email memorandum to C. Gatens re: specifics of upcoming mediation

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/26/2017	111C		3.00	690.00	Y	Travel to mediation
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/26/2017	111C		0.50	0.00	Y	Review trial brief (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/27/2017	111C		11.80	0.00	Y	Attend mediation and travel back to Wenatchee (no charge)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/04/2017	111C		0.70	161.00	Y	Research case law in support of response to motion to disqualify and arguments in FHFA's trial brief
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/07/2017	111C		1.60	0.00	Y	Attend telephonic pre trial conference; phone conference with co-counsel (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/07/2017	111C		0.40	92.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: hearsay objections (.2); begin researching pocket memos (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/08/2017	111C		2.20	506.00	Y	Office conference with K. Riley re: trial prep and logistics (.2); research case law re: FHFA's motion to disqualify (.9); continue researching Evidence Rules for pocket trial memos (1.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/11/2017	111C		1.40	322.00	Y	Continue researching and drafting trial pocket memos (1); office conference with C. Gatens re: next steps (.2); phone conference with C. Gatens re: hearsay memos (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/12/2017	111C		1.60	368.00	Y	Research re: [REDACTED] (1.1); office conferences with C. Gatens re: same and Defendant's exhibits (.2); begin researching trebling factors (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/13/2017	111C		6.00	1,380.00	Y	Continue researching and drafting pocket memos re: [REDACTED]
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/14/2017	111C		3.90	897.00	Y	Draft, revise, and continue researching pocket memorandums
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/15/2017	111C		3.80	874.00	Y	Continue researching and drafting pocket memos

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	02/26/2018	311CC		0.60	0.00	Y	Emails re: conference call with mediator (.1); review defendant's statement and Plaintiff's statement to mediator and stipulation (.5) (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	03/23/2018	311CCR		1.40	0.00	Y	Attend phone conference with opposing counsel; attend phone conference with co-counsel (NO CHARGE)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	03/23/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Office conference with opposing counsel re: letter, notice, conversations with safeguard (.4); emails with co-counsel re: same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	03/28/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Prepare agenda for and attend meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	03/28/2018	311CC		0.80	184.00	Y	Attend call with Nationstar counsel (.4); email memorandum re: same (.2); update email to co-counsel re: same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/16/2018	311CCR		0.30	0.00	Y	Review response to motion for second notice NO CHARGE
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/18/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Review response to motion to expedite and review court's order on motion to expedite
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/22/2018	311CC		1.00	230.00	Y	Review response to motion to intervene and emails with co counsel re: proposed revisions
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/23/2018	311CC		0.50	115.00	Y	Review final proposed revisions to response to motion to intervene and supporting declaration
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/24/2018	311CC		1.10	253.00	Y	Review reply to motion to intervene and declaration in support (.4); review order denying motion to intervene (.3); phone call with c. Gatens re: same and effect on claims splitting argument (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	04/25/2018	311CC		0.70	161.00	Y	Sit in on telephonic oral argument with the court and phone conference with C. Gatens re: same

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/02/2018	311CC		0.70	161.00	Y	Prepare agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: strategy and case status
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/03/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Emails re: bankruptcy notice and instructions to M. Reeder re: same
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/04/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Office conference with Michaela re: bankruptcy trustee project (.1); emails with co counsel re: same and upcoming tasks (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/04/2018	311CC		0.40	92.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: Nationstar's recent offer (.3); office conference with Michaela re: bankruptcy trustee analysis (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/08/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Review bankruptcy list sort by lock change (.2); teleconference with co counsel re: Nationstar's offer, bankruptcy notice (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	05/09/2018	311CC		0.40	92.00	Y	Emails with M. Reeder re: bankruptcy trustee research status and questions (.1); prepare agenda for and attend weekly meeting with C. Gatens re: strategy and case status (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/05/2018	311CC		0.90	207.00	Y	Prepare agenda for and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy (.6); instructions to staff re; gearing back up for trial prep (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/07/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Prepare for trial (.4); emails coordinating outstanding tasks and preparation materials (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/08/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Begin reviewing depositions in preparation for trial (.2); review emails with class representative re: case status (.1); emails re: propriety of moving to enforce settlement (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/11/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Emails with co counsel re: preparation for trial

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/13/2018	311CC		0.70	161.00	Y	Office conference with co counsel re: trial prep and tasks
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/14/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Prepare for and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: strategy and case status
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/15/2018	311CC		0.50	115.00	Y	Instructions to M. Reeder re: loan file review (.2); research re: loan files and comment histories (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/19/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Emails with M. Reeder re: loan file review (.1); review emails with co counsel re: upcoming deadline for motions in limine and exhibit list (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/20/2018	311CC		1.20	276.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: trial prep (.2); continue reviewing depositions (.3); Research re: PPC Broadband v. Corning Optical re: obligation to satisfy judgment pending appeal (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/21/2018	311CC		2.50	575.00	Y	prepare for and attend call with opposing counsel I re: trial prep (.6); call with co counsel re: same (.3); review new summary exhibits (.8); Prepare agenda for and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/25/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Review proposed pre trial order and redlines to same (.4); review emails with co counsel and opposing counsel re: same (.1); emails with Michaela Reeder re; loan file review (.1):
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/26/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Internal emails re: re-filing motions in limine (.1); phone conference with M. Reeder re: loan file review status (.2)

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/27/2018	311CC		2.20	506.00	Y	Emails with M. Reeder and K. Riley re: summary exhibits and file review (.2); research summary exhibits (.5); review emails with FHFA attorneys re: participation at trial (.1); meeting with M. Reeder and C. Gatens re: file review (.2); emails with co counsel re: public records and supplemental exhibit list (.2); begin research re: hearsay exemptions to public records (.3); Prepare agenda for and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/28/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Emails with Michaela and Kathy re: loan file review and appropriate list (.1); phone conference with C. Gatens re: Laura's testimony (.1); ghost email to Laura re: upcoming testimony (.2); compile trial prep materials (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	06/29/2018	311CC		0.40	92.00	Y	Phone call with C. Gatens re: 59.04 and offset research
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/02/2018	311CC		1.50	345.00	Y	Review motion in limine and response and revisions to response and correspond with co counsel re: same (.7); continue researching 803 hearsay exceptions, emails with M. Daudt re: same (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/03/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Review trial preparation list (.2); emails with K. Riley re: upcoming tasks (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/05/2018	311CC		1.30	299.00	Y	Review Michaela's document analysis and excel sheet (.3); prepare for and attend meeting with M. Reeder re: document analysis (.4); emails with co counsel re: apportioning tasks (.2); review revisions to agreed pre-trial order and emails re: same (.4)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/06/2018	311CC		0.70	161.00	Y	Emails with opposing counsel re: trial brief and exhibits (.2); begin research re: offsets and setbacks under RCW 7.28.230 (.3); phone call with C. Gatens re: same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/08/2018	311CC		2.00	460.00	Y	Research re: offset arguments and rental value percentage arguments in support of trial brief
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/09/2018	311CC		7.20	1,656.00	Y	Continue research re: offset claim and arguments in opposition (4.9); draft revisions to trial brief and review revised and final versions (.7); office conferences with C. Gatens re: same (.4); review Nationstar's trial brief and arguments (.9); emails with co-counsel and opposing counsel re: trial prep (.1); communications with K. Riley re: absent class member M. Laird (.1); begin reviewing updated exhibits (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/10/2018	311CC		4.20	966.00	Y	Review Kilpatrick credentials and background research (.4); continue reviewing trial briefs and preparing for trial (.4); meeting with Michaela re: document review (.6); internal emails re: scheduling meeting with Court staff in preparation for electronics at trial (.1); office conference with E. Stokes re: pocket briefs, trial prep (.2); phone call and emails with L. Peterson, office conference with C. Gatens re: same (.6); draft agenda for and attend meeting with C. Gatens and K. Riley re: case status, strategy, and trial preparation and administration (1.9)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/11/2018	311CC		0.50	115.00	Y	Internal emails re; Scheduling IT review/prep (.2); instructions to Staff re: redacting documents (.1); review sample exhibits to be redacted (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/12/2018	311CC		1.10	253.00	Y	Attend call with opposing counsel re: settlement terms and agreement (.4); review C, Gatens' revisions to agreement and exhibits (.5); internal emails and instruction to paralegal and associate team re: hold on trial prep (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/18/2018	311CC		0.50	115.00	Y	Review defendant's proposed revisions to settlement agreement and discuss with C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/19/2018	311CC		1.10	253.00	Y	Prepare for and attend pre trial conference with Court, draft memorandum to file re: same (.7); revise settlement agreement, office conferences with c. Gatens re: same (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/20/2018	311CC		1.10	253.00	Y	Research re: attorneys fee denial and briefing in re securities lending club litigation (ND Cal), email memorandum re: same (.5); Emails with co-counsel re: settlement tip over terms (.2); review opt out data (.1); draft agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/23/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Internal emails and emails with co-counsel re: exhibits to settlement agreement (.1); phone call with C. Gatens re: next steps (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/24/2018	311CC		0.90	207.00	Y	Generate, review, and spot check fees and costs report (.6); call with C. Gatens and meet with IT department re: same (.3)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/25/2018	311CC		1.20	276.00	Y	Phone calls and emails with C. Gatens and co counsel re: fee request revisions and forum rates (.2); revise, spot check, and review fee revisions (.3); review draft motion for preliminary approval and declaration (.6); research re: forum rates (.3); review court's letter and order (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/26/2018	311CC		0.90	207.00	Y	Phone call with c. Gatens re: preliminary approval revisions (.3); review emails with opposing counsel re: multiplier and forum fees (.1); Prepare for and attend meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/27/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Research re: acceptable and appropriate billing narratives (.3); office conferences with J. Thull re: fee sorts and write down identifications (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/30/2018	311CC		0.40	92.00	Y	Draft task list and proposed apportionment of work, office conference with C. Gatens and meeting with co counsel re: same
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	07/31/2018	311CC		0.80	184.00	Y	Emails with co-counsel re: revisions to preliminary approval motion and supporting declarations, office conference with C. Gatens re: same (.2); prepare for and attend meeting with co-counsel re: work allocation, strategy, fee request (.5); emails with cocounsel re: fee request cases and multiplier (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/01/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Instructions to K. Riley re: following up with expert and administrator and review Laura's revised declaration (.1); work on revisions to fee report (.1)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/09/2018	311CC		0.60	138.00	Y	Prepare agenda for and attend meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/14/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Phone call with co counsel re: settlement status
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/15/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Review communications with absent class members re: settlement
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/28/2018	311CC		0.40	92.00	Y	Draft agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	08/29/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Attend meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/07/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Prepare agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/10/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/17/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Instructions to staff re: update to L. Jordan on case status
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	09/20/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Prepare agenda for and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/02/2018	311CC		0.40	92.00	Y	Emails with C. Gatens and co-counsel re: status of motion for preliminary approval, office conference with C. Gatens re: same (.2); phone call with B. Chandler re: duplicate properties (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/03/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Draft agenda and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/16/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Prepare agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/17/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Attend meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/18/2018	311CCR		0.80	0.00	Y	Attend hearing on final approval, follow up emails with co-counsel re: same (.8) (No Charge)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/18/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens in preparation for hearing on preliminary approval (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/22/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Phone call with co-counsel re: bankruptcy class members, notice referencing Safeguard action
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/23/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Office conference with K. Riley and C. Gatens re: venue determinations for bankruptcy class members
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/24/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Prepare agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/25/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	10/31/2018	311CC		2.10	483.00	Y	Revise joint supplemental submission (1.5); office conference and phone call with M Daudt and C. Gatens re: same (.4); prepare agenda for and attend meeting with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/01/2018	311CCR		1.40	0.00	Y	Revise bankruptcy calculations, emails with co counsel re: same, revise supplemental briefing (No Charge)
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/02/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Review trustee's proposed revisions to supplemental briefing
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/06/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Phone call with co counsel re: bankruptcy issues, supplemental submission
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/07/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Prepare agenda for and attend office conference with C. Gatens re: case status and strategy
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/26/2018	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Review order granting preliminary approval and deadlines set forth in same
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/27/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Review settlement deadlines, emails with K. Riley and C. Gatens re: same

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	11/28/2018	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Phone conference with B. Chandler and C. Gatens re: upcoming briefing, deadlines
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/04/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Emails with administrator and co counsel re: notice, intern emails re: errors in fair market rental value calculations
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	12/19/2018	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Emails with C. Gatens, staff, and co counsel re: damage amounts, updated calculations
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/02/2019	311CC		0.20	46.00	Y	Research re: claims of class member Marylyn Laird, emails with cocounsel re: same and review objection letter
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/03/2019	311CC		0.10	23.00	Y	Prepare agenda for meeting with C. Gatens re: case status, strategy, conversations with absent class members
2011.0386	0001C	DAG	01/16/2019	311CC		0.30	69.00	Y	Work re: Jordan fees; office conference with C. Gatens re: same
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/12/2016	111C		4.10	943.00	Y	Research persuasive authority of damages
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/13/2016	111C		2.60	598.00	Y	Research persuasive authority of damages
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/14/2016	111C		2.80	644.00	Y	Continue research re damages
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/15/2016	111C		2.50	0.00	Y	Continue research re damages
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/21/2016	111C		2.00	0.00	Y	Verify survey re persuasive authority on damages
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	09/26/2017	111C		0.40	92.00	Y	Office meeting with C. Gatens re: expert witness issue (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	10/04/2017	111C		0.80	184.00	Y	Research re: expert witness issue (.4); office meeting with C. Gatens re: expert witness issue (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	10/06/2017	111C		0.90	207.00	Y	Expert witness assessment
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	10/27/2017	111C		1.10	253.00	Y	Expert report analysis and review
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	10/30/2017	111C		0.30	69.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens (.15), initial review of email (.15)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/10/2018	311CCR		0.10	23.00	Y	Office conference with DAG re: pocket briefs and trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	EWS	07/11/2018	311CCR		2.20	506.00	Y	Draft hearsay pocket brief
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	09/19/2013	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	research: submission of electronic media to court for a motion hearing
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/28/2013	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	research: commonality/typicality in class action certifications where Deed of Trust terms differ in language but not effect
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/11/2014	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	research re: damages available under CPA and CAA
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/18/2014	111C		1.70	484.50	Y	research re: CPA treble damages
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/07/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	review objection to class action order
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/08/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	review draft of response to objection to order
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/09/2014	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	attend oral argument re: class certification
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/09/2014	111C		1.70	484.50	Y	research re: appeal/discretionary review of certification order
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/16/2014	111C		4.80	1,368.00	Y	research and format re: class action notice content
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/19/2014	111C		7.10	2,023.50	Y	draft Notice with 23(b)(1) language
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/20/2014	111C		2.50	712.50	Y	finalize motion to amend certification
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/28/2014	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	finalize draft of 23(b)(3) notice
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	09/29/2014	111C		3.70	1,054.50	Y	begin draft of Answer to MDR
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	09/30/2014	111C		3.80	1,083.00	Y	continue draft of MDR Answer
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/01/2014	111C		7.10	2,023.50	Y	continue draft of answer to MDR
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/02/2014	111C		3.30	940.50	Y	finalize draft of answer to MDR
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/06/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	finalize answer to MDR
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/16/2014	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	review response to motion for protective order and propose revisions
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/04/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	research per re: SDTs, 30(b)(6) deposition
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/06/2014	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	strategy session with C. Gatens re: next steps

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/06/2014	111C		1.90	541.50	Y	research FRAPs for guidelines re: appeal of attorneys fees judgment (1.4); research re: timeliness of appeal (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/07/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	check procedural posture of MDR re: certification
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/12/2014	111C		7.10	2,023.50	Y	draft 4th Interrogatories and RFPs; 30(b)(6) notices, SDTs
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/13/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	meeting with C. Gatens re: appellate arguments, next steps
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/14/2014	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	phone conf. with C. Gatens & Mike Daudt re: ninth circuit appeals, 30(b)(6) depositions, next steps
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/14/2014	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	redraft 30(b)(6) notice to be broader and survive objection
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/18/2014	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	finalize redraft of 30(b)(6) notice re: PPM policies; office conference with C. Gatens re: stipulated acceleration of attorneys fees appeal
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/19/2014	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	draft response to mediator request re: issues ripe for mediation
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/20/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	meeting with C. Gatens re: status of hearings, discovery
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/24/2014	111C		1.70	484.50	Y	begin review of MDR re Class Certification pleadings for upcoming 12/3 hearing
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	12/01/2014	111C		7.80	2,223.00	Y	prepare for 12/3 hearing re discretionary review of certification order
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	12/03/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	prepare for Division III telephonic hearing and argue at hearing
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	12/04/2014	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: appellate hearing and case status
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	12/18/2014	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	review of Div III denial of review of class cert. order

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/20/2015	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	review Nationstar motion to modify (.3); office conference with C. Gatens re: motion to modify, planned response (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/22/2015	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	Review C. Gatens memo (1); Meeting w/ J. Aylward, C. Gatens meeting (1)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/22/2015	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	begin draft of answer to motion to modify
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/23/2015	111C		5.90	1,681.50	Y	continue to revise answer to motion to modify
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/26/2015	111C		1.90	541.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: 9th Circ. appeal of attorneys fees (.3); review Nationstar Brief, preliminary research re: scope of review, standard of review (1.6)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/26/2015	111C		4.60	1,311.00	Y	complete draft of answer to motion to modify
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/27/2015	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	begin ninth circuit appellee's brief re attnys fees
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/28/2015	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	make final edits to answer to motion to modify
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/03/2015	111C		4.20	1,197.00	Y	research 9th Cir. brief requirements; begin draft of Ninth Cir. Brief re Attnys Fees
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/04/2015	111C		6.00	1,710.00	Y	continue draft of Appellee's Brief re: Attnys fees
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/05/2015	111C		0.90	256.50	Y	continue draft of appellee's brief re: attnys fees
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/06/2015	111C		4.70	1,339.50	Y	continue draft of appellee's brief re attnys fees
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/09/2015	111C		1.60	456.00	Y	finalize draft of appellee's brief (1.1); begin redraft to comply with consolidated appeal (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/19/2015	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	review Daudt draft of Appellate Brief re: Attnys Fees
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/20/2015	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: case status

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/21/2015	111C		1.60	456.00	Y	research per C. Gatens re: other treatises re: CAFA
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/25/2015	111C		3.60	1,026.00	Y	continue research re: secondary sources discussing CAFA removal
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	02/26/2015	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	continue research re: analysis/application of Dart Cherokee in preparing for hearing
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/02/2015	111C		4.00	1,140.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: upcoming 9th Cir. Argument (1.9); review other Durham case on docket per C. Gatens (2.1)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/04/2015	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	oral argument discussion with C. Gatens, create flowchart of relevant statutes per C. Gatens request
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/09/2015	111C		1.60	456.00	Y	watch 9th Cir. argument
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/11/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: 9th Cir. argument
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	04/02/2015	111C		3.10	883.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens, R. Siderius re: next steps after 9th Cir. Opinion (.4); research process for reviewing decision, begin draft of FRAP 40 Petition for Rehearing (2.7)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	04/09/2015	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	phone conf with C. Gatens and Mike Daudt re: FRAP 40 petition, status of case after removal
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/27/2015	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	review Nationstar MSJ re: entry provisions (1.3); research re: filing MSJ prior to 26(f) conf., deadlines for filing/responding to MSJ (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/28/2015	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	research re: deadlines to file various msj documents re enforceability of entry provision (1.5); office conference with C. Gatens re: Nationstar's MSJ (1.3)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	05/29/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: strategy on how to respond to MSJ and submit our own MSJ

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/02/2015	111C		3.60	1,026.00	Y	research re: response to MSJ re: questions of law/fact; begin draft of response (3.1); office conference with C. Gatens and M. Green re: arguments in response to MSJ, our own MSJ (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/04/2015	111C		3.50	997.50	Y	research re: cases cited in Nationstar MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/08/2015	111C		2.40	684.00	Y	research re restatement of property third future possession agreements; office conference with C. Gatens plan for drafting response to MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/09/2015	111C		4.00	1,140.00	Y	draft response to MSJ re: distinguish cases cited by Nationstar
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/10/2015	111C		3.10	883.50	Y	continue draft of response to msj re: license
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/15/2015	111C		2.80	798.00	Y	review and edit draft of response to MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/16/2015	111C		2.10	598.50	Y	draft statement of specific facts re: response to msj
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/17/2015	111C		1.60	456.00	Y	finalize responsive brief re msj, specific facts relied on
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/18/2015	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: next steps
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/25/2015	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	06/29/2015	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	review reply to MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/06/2015	111C		2.70	769.50	Y	begin draft of MSJ re self-help provisions
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/07/2015	111C		0.90	256.50	Y	continue draft of msj
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/09/2015	111C		2.40	684.00	Y	draft msj section for RCW 7.60
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/10/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	finalize draft of 7.60 portion of msj
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/21/2015	111C		0.90	256.50	Y	review of Nationstar response to MSJ, office conference with C. Gatens re reply strategy

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/22/2015	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens, B. Huber, R. Siderius, DK re: reply to MSJ, assignment of tasks
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/23/2015	111C		6.20	1,767.00	Y	begin draft of RCW 7.60 section of MSJ reply
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/24/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and D. Gray re: license argument for MSJ reply
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/27/2015	111C		2.60	741.00	Y	edits to msj reply per C. Gatens re: citations (2.2); office conference with C. Gatens re MSJ reply (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/30/2015	111C		8.50	2,422.50	Y	review file and attend msj re entry provisions
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/10/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re next steps, possible amendment (.3); review order from E.D. WA re: certification of questions to WA Sup. Ct. (1); Office conference with RRS and C. Gatens re certification (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/12/2015	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	research re: certified questions, procedure and argument
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/14/2015	111C		1.20	342.00	Y	complete research re: certified questions to supreme court (.9); phone conf with SC clerk re perfection schedule, certification process (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/18/2015	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	research re amicus brief process (.45); office conference with C. Gatens re: supreme court argument (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/19/2015	111C		2.40	684.00	Y	research re Supreme Court briefing, begin drafting brief
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/21/2015	111C		2.80	798.00	Y	research re public policy argument
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/24/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	continue to compile certified case file (.6); begin statement of case, introduction (.9)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	09/10/2015	111C		1.20	342.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re SC argument (.6); edits to policy arguments per C. Gatens (.6)

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	09/11/2015	111C		2.20	627.00	Y	continue policy and conduct office conference with C. Gatens re brief
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	09/14/2015	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	edits to SC brief
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/27/2015	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	begin review of response to SC Brief
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/28/2015	111C		2.30	655.50	Y	continue review of SC response (.3); draft motion for extension (1.7); office conference with C. Gatens overview of response (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/29/2015	111C		3.00	855.00	Y	complete review of briefing
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/30/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Office conference with co-counsel re plan to reply SC brief; office conference with C. Gatens re next steps
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/02/2015	111C		1.90	541.50	Y	Research and draft outline for SC reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/03/2015	111C		1.20	342.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and M. Green (.5); draft outline to SC Brief (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/12/2015	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	review reply draft for format
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/13/2015	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	draft reply to SC brief re RCW 7.60
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/17/2015	111C		3.50	997.50	Y	review draft reply, office conference with C. Gatens re draft
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	11/19/2015	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	edits to policy section of reply brief per C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	12/10/2015	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	research re time from certification to written decision
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/08/2016	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	review amicus replies
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/12/2016	111C		2.60	741.00	Y	review Nationstar reply to amicus (1.6); outline argument with C. Gatens (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/19/2016	111C		10.50	0.00	Y	travel to and attend SC hearing (N/C)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/20/2016	111C		0.50	0.00	Y	Office conference with RRS re: SC argument (N/C)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/07/2016	111C		1.60	456.00	Y	review SC decision (1.2); office conference with C. Gatens re next steps (.4)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	07/21/2016	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	review msj briefing in light of Judge Rice order (.8); office conference with C. Gatens re same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	08/01/2016	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	consult with C. Gatens re motion for reconsideration
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/14/2016	111C		1.20	0.00	Y	review order re intervention
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	10/25/2016	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Research re possible challenges to preemption argument
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/06/2017	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	research appealability of denial of summary judgment and grant of partial summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	01/09/2017	111C		3.40	969.00	Y	Research re preemption
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/09/2017	111C	A104	2.80	798.00	Y	Court's denial re msj preemption (1.0); research re appeal under collateral order doctrine (1.8)
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	03/20/2017	111C	A102	1.00	285.00	Y	re time to appeal denial of msj re preemption per C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	HLL	04/10/2017	111C	A102	1.00	285.00	Y	research per C. Gatens re appeal certification language
2011.0386	0001C	HMH	03/01/2017	111C		1.39	139.00	Y	Research property owned by Jeffrey Ivie.
2011.0386	0001C	HMH	07/19/2017	111C		6.80	680.00	Y	Property Research of Condo Units.
2011.0386	0001C	HMH	07/20/2017	111C		2.65	265.00	Y	Property research for Condo Units.
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	06/26/2014	111C		8.00	800.00	Y	Research re: Deed of Trust Act
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	06/30/2014	111C		3.32	332.00	Y	continue research re: Deed of Trust Act
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/01/2014	111C		3.00	300.00	Y	Research re: effect of removal on time to file appeal and re: legislative history of RCW 61.24
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/03/2014	111C		1.20	120.00	Y	Research re: RCW 61.24
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/07/2014	111C		1.55	155.00	Y	Research re: appellate procedures on remand
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/08/2014	111C		3.00	300.00	Y	Research re: rules of appellate procedure
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/09/2014	111C		6.00	600.00	Y	Research re: Rules for discretionary appeal and interpretation of Deed of Trust Act

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/10/2014	111C		8.00	800.00	Y	Research re: appellate procedures and prevention of "waste"
2011.0386	0001C	JHO	07/11/2014	111C		5.75	575.00	Y	Researching remedies for "waste"
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	07/01/2014	111C		0.35	300.00	Y	Meet w/C. Gatens re self help remedies.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	11/04/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Strategy session w/C. Gatens re public policy argument.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	01/15/2015	111C		0.35	136.50	Y	Meet w/C. Gatens re covenants and right of entry.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	01/21/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Rec and review package of materials from C. Gatens for meeting (.5); conduct additional research (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	01/22/2015	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	Meeting re upcoming SJ.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	02/10/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Research re "hip pocket" deed.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	05/28/2015	111C		0.75	292.50	Y	Emails re motion, rec and review motion (.5); draft notes for meeting re motion (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	06/01/2015	111C		1.75	682.50	Y	Motion strategy meeting w/M. Green and C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	06/02/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Meeting w/C. Gatens re "constructive possession".
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	06/09/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Conference w/C. Gatens re possession
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	06/12/2015	111C		0.75	292.50	Y	Review draft brief and draft notes to C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	06/25/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Meeting w/C. Gatens and L. Lewis.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	07/22/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Meet w/C. Gatens re license argument.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	07/27/2015	111C		0.25	97.50	Y	Review reply brief and draft notes to C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	09/09/2015	111C		0.25	97.50	Y	Meet w/C. Gatens re brief to WA Sup Ct.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	09/14/2015	111C		1.75	682.50	Y	Review brief (.75); meet w/C. Gatens (.5); meeting w/group re brief (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	11/24/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Meet w/C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	JPA	01/12/2016	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	Attend and provide feedback for mock argument.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	07/31/2013	111C		2.25	641.25	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and conduct research re: pre-certification of class action & related discovery issues
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	08/01/2013	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	Continue research re: class action pre certification discovery
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	08/02/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re: pre-cert discovery
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	08/30/2013	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens & M. Green re: motion to cert class (.3); conduct additional research on motion to cert class (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	09/23/2013	111C		0.75	213.75	Y	Office conference with M. Green re class cert briefing (.25); research and draft citations to pleadings (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	09/26/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	research re: WA courts using Federal authority on class action
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/02/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	emails with group re: motion to certify class
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	03/13/2014	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	office conference with C. Gatens and conduct research re: certification and amending the complaint
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	03/14/2014	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	continue research re: class action procedure
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	03/31/2014	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	office conference with C. Gatens re: Certification Hearing
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	04/03/2014	111C		2.20	627.00	Y	prep for hearing and hearing re: class certification
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	05/07/2014	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	conduct research and draft agenda for Order for Class Certification meeting
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	05/09/2014	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	prep for hearing and attend hearing re: Order Certification Class Action
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/03/2014	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	conduct calls to class members regarding servicers of property preservation

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/06/2014	111C		1.10	313.50	Y	emails and calls to plaintiff class members regarding loan servicer information
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/07/2014	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	Calls to and from plaintiff class re: changing of locks
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/08/2014	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	emails with class members and calls to class members
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/09/2014	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	calls to individuals regarding company who changed locks
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/13/2014	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	emails and calls to class members
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/16/2014	111C		3.00	855.00	Y	research re: discovery and undue burden
2011.0386	0001C	LJW	10/17/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	calls to absent class members
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/15/2011	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: lodestar fee issues (.2); evaluate damages, potential causes of action, potential class action (.7); research re: trespass damages/FDCPA (.6).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/16/2011	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Research re: FDCPA claims and damages.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/09/2012	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: discovery requests and litigation strategy (.3); review complaint and answer (.3); draft letter to Laura re: same (.3); revise on discovery requests (.6).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/10/2012	111C		2.75	783.75	Y	Research and begin drafting subpoena duces tecum (1.6); draft letter to counsel (.4); begin drafting requests for admission; review rules re: service of subpoena and notice requirements (.25); revise Interrogatories/RFPs (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/11/2012	111C		2.50	712.50	Y	Continue drafting Interrogatories/RFPs (.9); revise subpoena and letter to J. Knox (.3); revise requests for admission (1.3)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/14/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Review subpoena service rules w/ C. Gatens; revise and coordinate service of letter to Knox (.1); draft letter to FAS and instr to asst re: service of subpoena (.2).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/16/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Revise letter to Field Asset Services (.2); revise requests for admission (.2); continue drafting additional Interrogatories/RFPs (.1).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/18/2012	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Continue revisions to discovery requests (.5); office conference w/ C. Gatens re: settlement discussions (.2).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/23/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Continue drafting Interrogatories/RFPs
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/24/2012	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Review update from process server re: subpoena and provide instructions to staff re: follow up
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/08/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Monitor Field Asset Services subpoena response and follow up instr to staff re: contact w/ FAS (.1); finalize RFAs and letter to J. Knox (.2); prepare for and attend phone conference w/opposing counsel C. Helling (.5); email w/ C. Helling and draft letter to C. Helling and amended subpoena duces tecum: (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/10/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Revise Interrogatories/RFPs.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/11/2012	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: discovery requests (.3); finalize Interrogatories/RFPs (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/18/2012	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Review letter from J. Knox.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/22/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Emails and calls w/C. Helling re: status of FAS response to subpoena duces tecum (.3); emails w/ C. Gatens re: privilege review request (.1):
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/02/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Call w/ C. Helling (.2); draft aff of records custodian (.2); email C. Helling re: same

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/03/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Emails w/ C. Helling (.1); review subpoena responses (.3).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/06/2012	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	V-mail from A. Noble re: discovery extension request (.1); return v-mail for noble confirming extension of discovery to July 27 acceptable (.1).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/09/2012	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Email J. Knox w/ FAS subpoena response
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/25/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Review FAS subpoena response (.2); consult w/ C. Gatens re: subpoena docs and additional requests needed (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/27/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Receive and review discovery responses from Nationstar.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/01/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Outline litigation strategy and meet w/ C. Gatens re: misc discovery issues and amendments to complaint.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/02/2012	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Begin drafting amended complaint for damages.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/03/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Continue drafting amended complaint (.3); begin drafting motion for leave to amend, proposed order granting leave (.5); research re: potential claim under 61.24 (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/05/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Research RE: cpa claims and potential claims under 61.24 (.4); work on amended complaint (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/06/2012	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Email J. Knox (.1); revise subpoena to .MSI
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/07/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Emails w/ J. Knox (.1); revise subpoena to MSI (.1); letter to J. Knox and letter to MSI via process server (.1).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/08/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Research re: cpa and fdcpa claims (.6); continue drafting amended complaint (.4)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/13/2012	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Emails w/ opposing counsel re: discovery issues.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/14/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Continue drafting motion to amend complaint, order granting leave, declaration of mag, and proposed amended complaint (.9); emails re: subpoena service issues (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/15/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Further revisions to motion to amend pleadings.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/16/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Continue revising amended complaint and additional causes of action
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/17/2012	111C		1.60	456.00	Y	Listen to audio file (.2); continue drafting amended complaint (1.4)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/19/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Finalize motion and pleadings re: amendment to complaint
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/23/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Emails w/ counsel re: stipulation (.1); draft stipulation and order granting leave to amend (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/24/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Revise stipulation and order to amend (.2); email J. Knox re: same (.1).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/27/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Emails w/ counsel re: stipulation (.1); draft letter to clerk filing stip and provide instr to staff re: striking hearing (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/04/2012	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Follow up re: subpoena response.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/05/2012	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Follow up re: subpoena and enforcement issues.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/07/2012	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Research re: motion for contempt for failure to respond to subpoena.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/10/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: discovery issues and contempt motion re: failure to respond to subpoena (.2); email J. Knox re: same (.1).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/11/2012	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Review subpoena response status w/ C. Gatens and discuss motion for contempt (.1); emails with J. Knox re: same (.1).

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/25/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Review discovery (.6); consult w/ C. Gatens re: litigation strategy and settlement demands (.2); outline litigation plan (.2).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/03/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Rec and review amended answer (.2); review discovery and email J. Knox re: supplemental responses and subpoena status (.2); email from A. Noble re: MSI subpoena (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/25/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Rec and review request for employment records and draft response
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/06/2012	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: delinquent subpoena response and status of supp discovery responses (.2); draft and revise motion to compel, declaration in supp of motion to compel, order granting motion to compel, and noteup (1.6)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/07/2012	111C		3.00	855.00	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatens and B. Huber (.6); research re: discovery and class action issues (.1); revise motion to compel, second amended complaint and motion for leave to amend (1.4).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/08/2012	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	Finalize amendment to complaint and instr to asst re: noting motions (.2); consult w/ C. Gatens re same (.1); research and draft affidavits of prejudice (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/12/2012	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Revise to compel pleadings and amended complaint
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/14/2012	111C		3.00	855.00	Y	Continue drafting motion for leave to amend, second amended complaint, motion to compel.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/15/2012	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	Revise motion to compel and second amended complaint.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/16/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Teleconference w/client and consult w/ C. Gatens re: discovery and motions.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/26/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Rec and review letter from counsel re: discovery responses (.3); consult w/ C. Gatens re: amended interrogatories (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/04/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Rec and review discovery requests from defendants (.1); research re: statement of damages and statute application (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/06/2012	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Research re: outstanding discovery issues.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/10/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Research re: discovery obligations and strategy re: amendment to complaint and request for damages.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/12/2012	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Review supplemental discovery responses (1.1) office conference C. Gatens re: MSI discovery (.3).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/13/2012	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Revise motion to amend, amended complaint, and coordinate hearing date.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/18/2012	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatens re: putative class definition/parameters and revisions to proposed amended complaint.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/19/2012	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Finalize motion to amend pleadings.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/21/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Teleconference w/ C. Gatens re: potential extension of hearing on motion to amend; emails w/ counsel.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/26/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Rec employer materials and begin reviewing (.2); email w/ J. Knox (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/27/2012	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Research re: statement of damages (.5); emails w/ J. Knox (.1); receive and review t-scan invoices (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/28/2012	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Emails w/ J. Knox and office conference w/ C. Gatens and B. Huber re: possible stipulation.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/31/2012	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Follow up w/ B. Huber re: hearing on order granting leave.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/23/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Emails w/ opposing counsel re: depts.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/28/2013	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens and B. Huber re: class certification and class discovery (.1); work on class discovery requests (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/30/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Revise re: second Interrogatories/RFPS (class discovery)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/31/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Multiple teleconference w/ C. Gatens re: deposition (.3); rec and review third discovery requests from Nationstar (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/04/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens re: additional discovery and subpoenas to non-parties.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/05/2013	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Review subpoenas, discovery, and responses to discovery.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/06/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Continue reviewing discovery and subpoenas.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/07/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Review FAS prior lawsuit research.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/20/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatens RE: discovery and outsnading issues (.2); emails w/ opposing counse re same (.1).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/21/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Continue reviewing discovery responses and productions
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/23/2013	111C		5.00	1,425.00	Y	Continue reviewing discovery responses and productions
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/27/2013	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Finalize discovery responses and coordinate service of same
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/04/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Rec and review letter from A. Noble re: discovery
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/08/2013	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	Conference call re: discovery issues w/ A. Noble and C. Gatens (.4); review letter from A. Noble re: discovery (.2)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/11/2013	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatensand conduct research re: additional causes of action, class cert process, and class damages.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/12/2013	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	continue research re: contractual mortgage provisions re: possession/receivers.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/15/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Rec and review additional discovery requests from Nationstar
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/19/2013	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Revise subpoena to MSI and letter to J. Knox/A. Noble (.4); review responses to requests for admission and 4th Interrogatories/RFPs (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/20/2013	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	revise MSI subpoena and letter to counse and coordinate service of same
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/28/2013	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Revise subpoena to MSI and provide instructions to staff re: service letter (.3); revise responses to 4th Interrogatories and responses to RFAs (.2); review and revise letters to J. Knox/A. Noble (.2).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/01/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	finalize discovery responses and letter to J. Knox/A. Noble.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/02/2013	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Draft second Interrogatories/RFPs re: class and third Interrogatories/RFPs re: additional liability issues.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/03/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Continue revising Interrogatories/RFPs (.2); draft responses to 4th Interrogatories/RFPs (.3).
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/04/2013	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	Revise class Interrogatories/RFPs.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/16/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	rec and review letter from A. Noble re: discovery issues (.1); review discovery responses (.1); draft response email to Noble (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/17/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Continue review of discovery issues, research re same
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/19/2013	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Research re: discovery issues.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/22/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Draft amended discovery responses
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/30/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Review MSI subpoena responses and meet w/ C. Gatens re: same
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/17/2013	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Meet w/ C. Gatens re: status of discovery and class research (.4); review memo from wade re: statutory damages and property abandonment guidelines (.2); research RE: FDCPA and commonality/statutory damages issues (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/21/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Review response from MSI to subpoena and emails w/ C. Gatens and K. Ferrera re: research in support to response to same
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/28/2013	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens re: offer of judgment and review response timeline.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/31/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatens re: litigation status and offer of judgment issues
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/15/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens re: discovery response issues and partial summary judgment motion
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/14/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatens and conduct research re: class certification and motion to compel issues
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/27/2013	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	review correspondence from Nationstar attorney re: discovery (.4); meet w/ C. Gatens re: class certification (.2); begin drafting class certification motion (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/28/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Emails w/ counsel (.1); continue drafting class certification memo/motion.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/29/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Revise letter to client
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/30/2013	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Meet w/ C. Gatens and L. Weidenbach (.3) continue drafting re: motion and memo to certify class(.3)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/05/2013	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Iupdate from L. Weidenbach re: motion to certify and injunctive relief standards upon certification (.2); emails w/ C. Gatens and client re: class action fee agreement (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/06/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Begin drafting class action fee agreement.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/08/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Further revisions to class action fee agreement and review email from bob re: contingency fee agreements.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/11/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Revise fee agreement and named plaintiff agreement and description of obligations
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/16/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	review and propose revisions letter from C. Gatens re: discovery issues
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/18/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Receive and review note up on hearing for motion to deny certification (.2); review letter from A. Noble re: discovery (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/19/2013	111C		1.80	513.00	Y	multiple consults w/ C. Gatens re: motion issues (.4); work on motion to compel and memo in support of motion to compel (1.4)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/22/2013	111C		5.00	1,425.00	Y	Meet w/ C. Gatens; (.2) revise motion to compel and supporting memo (3.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/23/2013	111C		1.40	399.00	Y	Continue drafting memo in support of motion to compel(1.2; meet w/ C. Gatens (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/25/2013	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	Meet w/ C. Gatens re outstanding motions (.4); continue drafting memo in support of motion to compel (.8); work on memo in support of class certification (.8)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/26/2013	111C		3.00	855.00	Y	Revise memo to compel and memo re: certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/27/2013	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens and revise motion and memorandum to certify class

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/01/2013	111C		2.50	712.50	Y	meet w/ C. Gatens and review responsive pleadings and declarations from Nationstar (1.4); emails w/ counsel (.2); begin drafting on reply brief (.8); draft letter to clerk (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/02/2013	111C		3.40	969.00	Y	Continue drafting reply in support of motion to compel (1.4); review Nationstar opposition to motion to certify and begin drafting reply for motion to certify and letter to clerk (1.9); message from Judge Small's assistant and exchange emails w/ counsel (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/03/2013	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Continue review of Nationstar's response on certification and outline reply brief (1.5); consult w/ C. Gatens re: same (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/04/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Meet w/ C. Gatens and continue drafting reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/10/2013	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens on certification and co counsel association issues
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/14/2013	111C		2.30	655.50	Y	Continue drafting reply brief re: certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/28/2013	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	consult w/ clay re: reply brief on certification and continue to revise
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/29/2013	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	research re: reply brief arguments on certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/30/2013	111C		3.20	912.00	Y	revise reply re: certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/04/2013	111C		3.50	997.50	Y	outline arguments for hearing w/ C. Gatens (2.9); prepare for and attend hearing on motion to certify and motion to compel (1.1); research re: lender obligation to obtain receiver (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/05/2013	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	review email from J. Knox and proposed order
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/14/2013	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	revise proposed orders

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/22/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	emails w/ counsel and clay re: proposed order
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/25/2013	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	consult w/ clay and work re: orders on motion to compel discovery
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/26/2013	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	email from counsel re: potential stipulation and consult w/ clay re: stip and note for presentment (.2); review RPC re: rules on solicitation of prospective clients (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/05/2013	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	review responsive pleadings from nation star re: order to compel discovery (.2); teleconference clay re: potential reply and counter arguments (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/09/2013	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	emails w/ counsel re: order on motion to compel.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/15/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	consult w/ clay and conduct intake calls for borrower
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/20/2014	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	emails w/ clay and counsel (.1); and begin drafting supp briefing to court (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/24/2014	111C		3.50	997.50	Y	draft supplemental briefing on abandonment issue (.9); review transcript and prior research in file in support of same (1.1); legal research re: common law mortgagee rights upon abandonment and effect of contractual provisions regarding receivers (1); begin drafting renewed motion for class certification (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/26/2014	111C		2.50	712.50	Y	revise supplemental brief in support of certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/27/2014	111C		4.50	1,282.50	Y	continue drafting and revising supplemental memo (4); conduct additional legal research in support of same (.5)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/28/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	review letter from A. Noble (.1); emails w/ bob and clay; re: supp brief (.1) review and revise letter to A. Noble (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/03/2014	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	meet w/ bob s re: class certification issues (.2); emails w/ bob/clay re: same and renewed motion (.2); meet w/ peter re: association of counsel (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/05/2014	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	meet w/ clay and revise supplemental brief on motion for certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/10/2014	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	meet w/ clay re: issues at hearing and potential new classes (.3); update to clay re: RCW 61.24 provisions on evidence of surrender of property (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/14/2014	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	meet w/ clay and draft discovery requests and requests for admission
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/16/2014	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	draft proposed order granting certification.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/17/2014	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	revise proposed order on certification
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/21/2014	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	revisions to proposed order on certification and consult w/ clay re: certification order and misc case issues
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/06/2014	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	review objection and proposed order from Nationstar
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/09/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	office conference w/C. Gatens re: issues on discretionary review
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/05/2014	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	review notice of removal
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/24/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	consult w/ clay re: contacts w/ trustee and pending foreclosure
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/08/2014	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	help C. Gatens prepare for hearing on motion for removal
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/11/2014	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	review notice of discretionary review (.3); consult w/ clay re: discretionary review issues (.4); research re: discretionary review and burden/standards, timing of stay, and motion and response timeline (1.3)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/15/2014	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	research re: discretionary review of orders denying class cert
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/17/2014	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	consult w/ clay re: case issues (.2); review petition to 9th circuit for leave (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/19/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	coordinate 9th circuit admissions
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/16/2014	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	review and revise protective order response
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/20/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	office conference w/C. Gatens re: motion for protective order
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/06/2014	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	research and draft memo re: enforceability of entry provisions
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/20/2014	111C		0.60	171.00	Y	Teleconference Shelby lemmel re: potential appeal of class decision
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/04/2014	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	consult w/ clay re: differences in entry provisions among deeds of trust for class members
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/22/2015	111C		1.30	370.50	Y	Meeting w/ C. Gatens and team and draft outline of claims and bases for non-enforcement of entry provisions (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/04/2015	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens re: subpoenas to preservation companies
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/06/2015	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	consult w/ L. Lewis and C. Gatens re: motion for reconsideration in 9th circuit
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/20/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens re: motions on enforceability, and potential amendments to complaint.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/27/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Research re: potential amendments to complaint causes of action, and motions re: liability
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/28/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	review Nationstar's motion for partial summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/01/2015	111C		3.80	1,083.00	Y	review Nationstar summary judgment briefing (2); office conference w/ J. Aylward, C. Gates re same (1.8)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/02/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	office conference w/ C. Gates re: response to msj and outline of argument.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/14/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	work on response brief for summary judgment
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/15/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Revise response brief for summary judgment and consult w/ C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	06/16/2015	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	review cases re: possession and interference with property rights.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/21/2015	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	review Nationstar response; consult w/ C. Gatens re: reply brief.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/22/2015	111C		1.20	342.00	Y	Draft reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	07/27/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	review and edit reply brief
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	08/10/2015	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	review order on summary judgment, consult w/ C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/01/2015	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Research supreme court briefing/arguments
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	09/10/2015	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	consult w/ C. Gatens (.6) ; work on supreme court briefing (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	02/27/2017	111C	WK	1.00	285.00	Y	Research analysis of Howard case and reasonable rent entitlement during pendency of mortgagee possession period.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	03/09/2017	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Review court order on summary judgment motion.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/26/2017	111C	WK	0.60	171.00	Y	Research class damage and rental value calculation issues and consult w/ C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	04/28/2017	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Review order from court denying interlocutory appeal; consult w/ C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	05/24/2017	111C	WK	0.30	85.50	Y	deposition subpoena issues.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/21/2017	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Review and discuss MSJ order.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	11/28/2017	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Teleconference C. Gatens re: mediation outcome and settlement positions.

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/12/2017	111C		2.50	712.50	Y	Research on trebling factors (2.1); research and draft memos re: exhibit objections and hearsay rules (.4)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/13/2017	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Research and discuss w/ C. Gatens evidence rules re: exclusion of photographs of property.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/14/2017	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	Research evidence rules re: authentication, hearsay, and admissibility of photographs and [REDACTED] (1.0); research re: admissibility of testimony from [REDACTED] (.7); review and revise pocket briefs from Devon G. re: evidence admissibility issues (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	12/15/2017	111C		2.00	570.00	Y	Continue research re: evidence exclusions and review and revise memos from D. Gray (1.6); revise settlement calculations (.2); consult w/ C. Gatens and analyze settlement offer (.2)
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	10/31/2018	311CC		1.50	427.50	Y	Research bankruptcy law regarding right to settlement proceeds for BK class members dismissed vs. discharged in BK.
2011.0386	0001C	MAG	01/07/2019	311CC		0.20	57.00	Y	Consult w/ C. Gatens re: objections to settlement and hearing on final approval.
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	09/18/2017	111C		0.10	0.00	Y	Contact U.S. Legal Services to arrange Court Reporter for two CR30(b)(6) depositions (McKee and Marais)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	09/19/2017	111C		0.10	10.00	Y	Schedule court reporter for depositions of Laurentius Marai and Bates McKee

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	09/21/2017	111C		0.50	50.00	Y	Final edits, prepare exhibits and send letter to Judge Rice regarding discovery conference 9/22/17
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/04/2017	111C		5.20	520.00	Y	Review of all property information on individual county Assessor and Recorder websites to locate missing end dates for purposes of determine damages to claim on behalf of class plaintiffs, locate each individual property on appropriate County website and confirm whether Deed entered for each
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/05/2017	111C		5.30	530.00	Y	Review of all property information on individual county Assessor and Recorder websites to locate missing end dates for purposes of determine damages to claim on behalf of class plaintiffs, locate each individual property on appropriate County website and confirm whether Deed entered for each (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/06/2017	111C		4.60	460.00	Y	Review of all property information on individual county Assessor and Recorder websites to locate missing end dates for purposes of determine damages to claim on behalf of class plaintiffs, locate each individual property on appropriate County website and confirm whether Deed entered for each (cont'd)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/09/2017	111C		6.80	680.00	Y	Review of all property information on individual county Assessor and Recorder websites to locate missing end dates for purposes of determine damages to claim on behalf of class plaintiffs, locate each individual property on appropriate County website and confirm whether Deed entered for each (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/10/2017	111C		4.20	420.00	Y	Review of all property information on individual county Assessor and Recorder websites to locate missing end dates for purposes of determine damages to claim on behalf of class plaintiffs, locate each individual property on appropriate County website and confirm whether Deed entered for each (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/11/2017	111C		0.60	60.00	Y	Review of all property information on individual county Assessor and Recorder websites to locate missing end dates for purposes of determine damages to claim on behalf of class plaintiffs, locate each individual property on appropriate County website and confirm whether Deed entered for each (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	10/31/2017	111C		3.00	300.00	Y	Compile and prepare trial exhibits identified by attorney and all exhibits Nationstar Mortgage admitted as Authentic via discovery and prepare Exhibit List for required pre-trial pleadings
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/02/2017	111C		2.30	230.00	Y	Review of 1500 Loans File received from Nationstar to locate data not provided in discovery to calculate class damages

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/03/2017	111C		2.80	280.00	Y	Review of 1500 Loans File received from Nationstar to locate data not provided in discovery to calculate class damages (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/06/2017	111C		1.30	130.00	Y	Continued revision of Plaintiff's Exhibit List with additional documents to be used as trial exhibits identified in continued review of 1500 Loans files from Nationstar
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/09/2017	111C		0.60	60.00	Y	Draft Plaintiff's Cross-Designations of testimony for trial in deposition of John Rangel
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/13/2017	111C		0.90	90.00	Y	Draft Plaintiff's Memorandum on Objections to Defendant's Witness List
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/13/2017	111C		0.80	80.00	Y	Draft Plaintiff's Objections to Defendant's Witness List
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/13/2017	111C		0.40	40.00	Y	Draft Declaration of Clay M. Gatens in Support of Plaintiff's Objections to Defendant's Witness List
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/21/2017	111C		2.10	210.00	Y	Calculate damage amounts for multiple damage scenarios for use in mediation brief/mediation negotiations
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/22/2017	111C		0.90	90.00	Y	Calculate additional damage amounts for multiple damage scenarios for use in mediation brief/mediation negotiations
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	12/11/2017	111C		1.40	140.00	Y	Review of various County Auditor records re select properties without end dates to locate sales information or disposal/foreclosure dates (220 properties)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	12/12/2017	111C		4.30	430.00	Y	Review of various County Auditor records re select properties without end dates to locate sales information or disposal/foreclosure dates (220 properties cont'd)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	12/13/2017	111C		4.90	490.00	Y	Review of Collection History Profiles for consent and compare to Defendant's Exhibit List to prepare for trial use
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	12/14/2017	111C		1.30	130.00	Y	Review of Collection History Profiles for consent and compare to Defendant's Exhibit List to prepare for trial use
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	02/02/2018	111C		2.20	220.00	Y	Review all documents produced to identify all Master Service Agreements, and identify all indemnification agreements within the agreements to be used for settlement negotiations
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	05/08/2018	111C		1.70	170.00	Y	Research to identify bankruptcy trustees to provide notice of settlement to
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	05/09/2018	111C		2.80	280.00	Y	Research to identify bankruptcy trustees to provide notice of settlement to (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	06/19/2018	111C		0.80	80.00	Y	Review file and create Excel table for property condition project for trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	06/27/2018	111C		0.30	30.00	Y	Meet with DAG and C. Gatens to discuss loan file review findings and next steps
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/02/2018	111C		3.60	360.00	Y	Review of Nationstar loan files; prepare comparison table to "Occupied Summary" document provided by Nationstar for trial prep
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/03/2018	111C		4.30	430.00	Y	Review of Nationstar loan files; prepare comparison table to "Occupied Summary" document provided by Nationstar for trial prep (cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/05/2018	111C		5.00	500.00	Y	Review and analysis of 130 loan files designated as trial exhibits by Nationstar for anything notable for trial (each file 2,000+ pages)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/09/2018	111C		4.40	440.00	Y	Review and analysis of 130 loan files designated as trial exhibits by Nationstar for anything notable for trial (each file 2,000+ pages) (Cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/10/2018	111C		4.70	470.00	Y	Review and analysis of 130 loan files designated as trial exhibits by Nationstar for anything notable for trial (each file 2,000+ pages) (Cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/11/2018	111C		5.30	530.00	Y	Review and analysis of 130 loan files designated as trial exhibits by Nationstar for anything notable for trial (each file 2,000+ pages) (Cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	07/12/2018	111C		3.20	320.00	Y	Review and analysis of 130 loan files designated as trial exhibits by Nationstar for anything notable for trial (each file 2,000+ pages) (Cont'd)
2011.0386	0001C	MCR	11/05/2018	111C		2.30	230.00	Y	Bankruptcy research project: find closing dates for all bankruptcies in table provided by Terrell Marshall
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/05/2013	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status and future handling of case.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	05/30/2013	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re class action issues and implications, offer of judgment (.9); teleconference with F. Siderius and C. Gatens re strategy for handling case (.6)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/05/2013	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Review of CR 68 Offer of judgment memo and status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/12/2013	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re settlement offer.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/15/2013	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and teleconference with F. Siderius re class certification issues.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/07/2013	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re facts of claim, potential class action and future handling.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/19/2013	111C		0.80	312.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens regarding motion for certification, motion to compel, strategy and status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/30/2013	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens regarding status claims.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	10/02/2013	111C		1.30	507.00	Y	Review of motion to compel, pleadings in support and in opposition (.6). Review of motion for class certification, pleadings in support and opposition (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	10/03/2013	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re motion for class certification.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	10/04/2013	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Teleconference with F. Siderius regarding status of Nationstar class certification motion and pleadings review.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	10/07/2013	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with MG re motion for class certification and response.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	10/09/2013	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	teleconference with Ray Siderius re class certification briefing and motion to compel. Office conference with C. Gatens re same.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	11/04/2013	111C		3.50	1,365.00	Y	Review of class certification pleadings (1.5) Office conference with C. Gatens re hearing (.8) Attend hearing on class certification (1.2)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	12/10/2013	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re discovery, status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	01/02/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status of discovery, organization of investigation.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	01/07/2014	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens, J. Danielson re pleadings status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	01/17/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re class action discovery and status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	02/15/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re discovery and renewed motion for class certification.

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	02/18/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re class certification and status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	02/19/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Review of motions timing email and respond to C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	02/24/2014	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	TC with witness Steven Thompson; draft declaration of same and exchange emails
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/12/2014	111C		0.70	273.00	Y	Follow-up communications w/witnesses re: declarations.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/18/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Revise witness declarations.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/18/2014	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status and future handling.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/21/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Teleconference with Justin Bagby re Nationstar lockout.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/24/2014	111C		0.80	312.00	Y	Review email from Scott Holloway and respond regarding issues on foreclosure (.3) Follow up with other witnesses on declarations (.5)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/24/2014	111C		0.70	273.00	Y	Prepare for and attend TC with Peter and with Ralph Polumbo regarding class-action claims.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/26/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Draft and finalize letters to clerk, court and counsel re declarations.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/29/2014	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	Review response re renewed motion for certification and begin drafting reply.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/31/2014	111C		2.80	1,092.00	Y	Continue drafting sections of reply brief in support of renewed motion for certification.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/01/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Review Reply memorandum.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/06/2014	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/15/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status and future handling.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	05/06/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Review proposed order on classification.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	05/07/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Review of proposed orders on class certification (.2) Office conference with LL, C. Gatens and LW re motion and hearing (.3)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	05/09/2014	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens and Mike Daudt re hearing on certification and future handling of claim.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/09/2014	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status and future handling.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/11/2014	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Teleconference with Dianna Jones re status of claims and foreclosure.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/16/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status of claims.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/18/2014	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Emails with Cody Weber re Nationstar lockout and declaration.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/19/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/23/2014	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	Emails with Cory Weber (.5); Research on property values (.3); draft declaration re lockout (.7)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/24/2014	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Emails with Cory Weber and revisions to declaration.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/25/2014	111C		1.20	468.00	Y	Review of Weber assessor info, credit report (.4) emails with Weber (.2) Review and Revise declaration for Weber (.5) Review of market rent (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/23/2014	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Review of email from McIney (.1) Review of pleadings on removal (.4) Respond with status report to McIney (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/28/2014	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/18/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with B. Huber and C. Gatens re status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/21/2014	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Review of supreme court rulings re class action claims.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/09/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Teleconference with C. Gatens re status and next steps
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/11/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Review of pleadings on discretionary review and share w/C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/17/2014	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/18/2014	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re motion to compel, motion for protective order.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	11/03/2014	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Review of Miller email (.1) Review pleadings and status (.1) Email to Miller re status (.1) Email to C. Gatens re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	01/14/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re strategy on motions.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	01/22/2015	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	Review of C. Gatens memo re status, office conference to discuss strategy.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	02/03/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	03/03/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Review of KING 5 news report on lockouts.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/02/2015	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference with L. Lewis and with C. Gatens re status of appeals, future handling.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/15/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Cont. fee group meeting, status and future handling of claim.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	04/22/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Emails to and from Cory Weber regarding status.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/12/2015	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Research re damages issues and email to C. Gatens and LL.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	06/15/2015	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Review of brief in support of motion for summary judgment, office conference with C. Gatens and email to C. Gatens regarding comments.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/20/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re SJ pleadings and argument.

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/21/2015	111C		3.50	1,365.00	Y	Review of Nationstar motion for summary judgment, Zamora Response, Nationstar reply, with exhibits. Review of Zamora motion for sj, Nationstar response.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/22/2015	111C		2.50	975.00	Y	Research on license, characteristics, limitations and grants (.2) Office conference regarding reply brief (2.3)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/24/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with DK re license research.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/27/2015	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Review of reply brief and email to C. Gatens.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/31/2015	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Review of status with LL.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/10/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re order on sj.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/17/2015	111C		0.40	156.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re mediation.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/20/2015	111C		0.20	78.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re supreme court briefing.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	01/12/2016	111C		1.50	585.00	Y	Review of briefing (.5); feedback mock argument (1.0)
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/07/2016	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Review of S. Ct. opinion.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	07/31/2017	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Rev of property valuation analysis.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	08/02/2017	111C		1.00	390.00	Y	Conf. with C. Gatens re update, strategy and future handling.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	09/07/2017	111C		0.80	312.00	Y	Rev of Rice decision re decertification motion.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	10/30/2017	111C		0.30	117.00	Y	Rev of emails and materials re mediation.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	11/22/2017	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Rev of order on SJ and conduct office conference with C. Gatens re affect on mediation.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	11/27/2017	111C		0.50	195.00	Y	Rev of mediation brief and attachments.
2011.0386	0001C	RRS	12/18/2017	111C		0.60	234.00	Y	Office conference with C. Gatens re settlement (.4). Draft email to JDSA re settlement, confidentiality (.2)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	05/15/2013	111C		3.50	805.00	Y	Class action and statutory/agency abandonment definition research
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	05/17/2013	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Discuss statutory damages and property abandonment w/ C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	11/03/2014	111C		0.80	184.00	Y	Research/Pull Amicus briefs and responses re Klem class action case and toll booth issues
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	11/03/2014	111C		0.40	92.00	Y	Review w/ C. Gatens re toll booth research and amicus briefs on class action law
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	01/27/2015	111C		2.85	655.50	Y	Conduct lockout case law query, review and summarize for C. Gatens
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	02/10/2015	111C		1.25	287.50	Y	pull/review filed pleadings re 9th Cir. class action case
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	05/15/2015	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Office conference w/ C. Gatens; research re existing lockout trespass/theft case law
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	05/29/2015	111C		0.50	115.00	Y	Research re Freddie/Fannie/HUD Deed of Trust Guidelines/Regs
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	06/05/2015	111C		4.00	920.00	Y	Research re lock out case law surviving MSJ/MTD; Freddie Mac/Fannie Mae
2011.0386	0001C	RWH	06/12/2015	111C		3.50	805.00	Y	Research re WA DoT, Freddie Mae/Freddie Mac, lock out cases surviving MSJ
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	09/14/2015	111C		3.50	997.50	Y	Review Plaintiff's Opening Brief for comment to C. Gatens (2.25); meet with C. Gatens, P. Aylward, B. Huber, and L. Lewis to discuss same (.75)
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	09/16/2015	111C		0.70	199.50	Y	Search online and by telephone for document to support Plaintiff's Opening Brief; communication with C. Gatens re same.
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	09/29/2015	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Legal analysis re subject matter of pending cases referenced in opposing counsel's Motion for Extension of Time (.2); communication with C. Gatens re same (.2)

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	09/30/2015	111C		0.30	85.50	Y	Continued legal analysis re subject matter of pending cases referenced in opposing counsel's Motion for Extension of Time
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	10/01/2015	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Complete legal analysis re subject matter of pending cases referenced in opposing counsel's Motion for Extension of Time
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/06/2015	111C		0.40	114.00	Y	Begin legal analysis re whether cases cited in Defendants' Response Brief originate from states that have a statute similar to RCW 7.28.230
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/09/2015	111C		4.70	1,339.50	Y	Continue legal analysis re whether cases cited in Respondent's Brief originate from states with statutes similar to RCW 7.28.230
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/09/2015	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Communication with C. Gatens re additional legal research needed.
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/13/2015	111C		3.20	912.00	Y	Legal analysis re whether municipal codes cited in Respondent's Brief are focused on the lender's or the borrower's obligations vis-a-vis the property
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/13/2015	111C		3.80	1,083.00	Y	Review Woodstock Institute article "Unresolved Foreclosures: Patterns of Zombie Properties in Cook County;" legal analysis re same
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/17/2015	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Conference with C. Gatens re research needed on number of vacant/foreclosed homes in Washington state.
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/18/2015	111C		0.80	228.00	Y	Legal analysis re number of vacant and foreclosed homes in Washington
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/18/2015	111C		1.50	427.50	Y	Legal analysis re adding the word "reasonable" to an otherwise unconscionable contract does not save it

Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn Aylward, P.S.

Jordan v. Nationstar Mortgage

2011.0386.0001c

Client Code	Matter Code	Atty Code	Date	Task Code	Activity Code	Hours	Value	Billable	Description
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	12/10/2015	111C		1.00	285.00	Y	Review Washington State Rules of Appellate Procedure re the filing of supplemental authority
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	12/10/2015	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Research re filing of AG's memo in support of Plaintiff and construction of oral argument relevant to same.
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	01/19/2016	111C		10.50	0.00	Y	Travel to/from and attend C. Gatens' oral argument in front of the Washington Supreme Court. (N/C)
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	07/11/2016	111C		0.10	28.50	Y	Research on legal analysis needed re recoverable damages under the Washington Consumer Protection Act.
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	08/30/2016	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Legal analysis re Consumer Protection Act damage calculations (.4); email to C. Gatens re same (.1)
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	11/17/2016	111C		0.50	142.50	Y	Research re federal preemption.
2011.0386	0001C	SFW	12/05/2016	111C		0.20	57.00	Y	Conference with C. Gatens re case status/next steps.

3,599.53 1,145,790.35

— EXHIBIT 2 —

HON. SALVADOR MENDOZA JR.

Clay M. Gatens
Devon A. Gray
Jeffers, Danielson, Sonn & Aylward, P.S.
PO Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688
(509) 662-3685 / (509) 662-2452

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT
EASTERN DISTRICT OF WASHINGTON

VALERIE RHODES, a single woman,
and on behalf of others similarly situated,

Plaintiff,

vs.

WELLS FARGO BANK, NATIONAL
ASSOCIATION, A National Banking
Association

Defendant.

NO. 2:17-CV-0093-SMJ

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN
SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S MOTION
FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES, COSTS,
EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

CLASS ACTION

LILI SOTELO, pursuant to 28 U.S.C. § 1746, declares:

1. I am over 18 years of age, make this declaration based upon my own personal knowledge, and I am competent to testify to the matters asserted herein.

2. During the 2016-2017 legislative session I was a Directing Attorney for Columbia Legal Services. Columbia Legal Services is a non-profit civil legal aid

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES,
COSTS, EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

1 program that has provided legal representation for low-income individuals since the
2 1960's. Columbia Legal Service's mission is to seek social and economic justice for all.

3 3. During the 2016-2017 legislative session I acted as a homeowner and
4 consumer advocate on behalf of Columbia Legal Services. In this role I participated in
5 the stakeholder group assembled by House Representative Tina Orwall to address
6 proposed legislation relating to the non-judicial foreclosure statute, RCW 61.24 *et. seq.*,
7 that included proposed changes to allow for pre-foreclosure entries into borrowers'
8 homes who were in default on their home loan obligations.

9 4. Representative Orwall was the sponsor of these proposed amendments,
10 which became proposed House Bill 2057 for the 2016-2017 legislative session.

11 5. My role in participating in this working group was to protect the rights of
12 Washington homeowners and consumers. Joseph Jordan with Northwest Justice Project,
13 and Clay Gatens also served as homeowner and consumer advocates during this
14 legislative session.

15 6. Other participants in the working group included members of, and lobbyists
16 for, the banking, loan servicing, and property preservation interest groups. These interest
17 groups were lobbying for legislation that would allow for pre-foreclosure entry into
18 defaulting borrowers' homes with little to no oversight or protection for the homeowners.

19 7. The banking, loan servicing, and property preservation interest groups
20

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES,
COSTS, EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

- Page 2

43N4184

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 specifically sought a so-called legislative “fix” to the *Jordan v. Nationstar* decision
2 issued by the Washington State Supreme Court in July 2016. Mr. Gatens was the lead
3 plaintiff’s counsel in that case and was successful in his efforts to invalidate the form
4 entry provision that lenders, loan servicers, and property preservation companies had
5 purported to rely upon to conduct pre-foreclosure lock changes and other activities prior
6 to the *Jordan* decision. Specifically, the lender, loan servicers, and property preservation
7 companies were seeking legislation that would grant them retroactive immunity for the
8 pre-foreclosure lock changes they conducted prior to (and in some cases even after) the
9 *Jordan* decision.

10 8. These working group meetings began in November 2016 and continued
11 through the extended 2016-2017 legislative session, which ended in June of 2017. This
12 session went into three extended sessions and ended on June 20, 2017. In all, the 2016-
13 2017 legislative session lasted 193 days and was one of the longest legislative sessions in
14 Washington state history.

15 9. Mr. Jordan, Mr. Gatens, and I participated in the working group
16 meetings and advocated for homeowners and consumers and opposed much of the
17 legislation promoted by the lender, loan servicer, and property preservation industries –
18 including the effort to create retroactive immunity in favor of these industries at the
19 expense of homeowners and consumers.

20 10. Our participation included not just attendance at the weekly or bi-weekly

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES,
COSTS, EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

- Page 3

43N4184

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1 stakeholder meetings, but also testifying in front of the Senate Judiciary Committee and
2 drafting and revising multiple proposed revisions and additions to proposed HB 2057.

3 11. These efforts were hard fought and took a considerable amount of time and
4 commitment from me, Mr. Jordan, and Mr. Gatens over the course of 8 months.

5 12. Ultimately, we were successful in our efforts and HB 2057 did not pass.

6 13. It is my opinion that a significant reason the proposed legislation did not
7 pass with the proposed retroactive immunity sought by the lender, loan servicing and
8 property preservation interest groups was because of the homeowner advocates, including
9 Mr. Gatens. Had the lender, loan servicers, and property preservation interest groups
10 been successful in their efforts to enact legislative immunity for pre-foreclosure entries
11 and lock changes in favor of lenders, loan servicers, and property preservation
12 companies, these industries would have escaped the liabilities they faced for their
13 unlawful pre-foreclosure entries and lock changes and the homeowners that had been
14 injured by these actions would have lost their ability to recover any damages.

15 14. Moreover, had the lenders, loan servicers, and property preservation
16 interest groups been successful in their efforts, the important injunctive relief sought by
17 Mr. Gatens on behalf of the plaintiffs he represents would have been rendered moot and
18 pre-foreclosure entries and lock changes would have been allowed to re-continue with little
19 to no regulatory oversight or substantive protections for distressed consumers and
20 homeowners who were in default on their home loans.

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES,
COSTS, EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

- Page 4
43N4184

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the state of Washington that the foregoing is true and correct.

DATED this 26 day of September, 2018.



LILI SOTELO

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF'S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES,
COSTS, EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

- Page 5

43N2843

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on the 1st day of October, 2018, I electronically filed the foregoing with the Clerk of the Court using the CM/ECF System. Notice of this filing will be sent to the parties listed below by operation of the Court’s electronic filing system. Parties may access this filing through the Court’s system.

Rudy A. Englund: englundr@lanepowell.com
David C. Spellman: spellmand@lanepowell.com
Jane E. Brown: brownje@lanepowell.com
Jennifer Sheffield sheffieldj@lanepowell.com

DATED at Wenatchee, Washington this 1st day of October, 2018.

s/CLAY M. GATENS
Clay M. Gatens, WSBA No. 34102
Attorney for Plaintiff
JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
2600 Chester Kimm Road
P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688
Telephone: 509-662-3685
Fax: 509-662-2452
Email: ClayG@jdsalaw.com

DECLARATION OF LILI SOTELO IN SUPPORT OF
PLAINTIFF’S MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS’ FEES,
COSTS, EXPENSES AND SERVICE AWARD

JEFFERS, DANIELSON, SONN & AYLWARD, P.S.
Attorneys at Law
(509) 662-3685 / FAX (509) 662-2452
2600 Chester Kimm Road / P.O. Box 1688
Wenatchee, WA 98807-1688